Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Tarnjit Singh, Belveen Singh <Belveen.Singh@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2024 5:13 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Tam, Ivan-WK; Admin A

Subject: RE: Case Assignment TP - SMQ7536G - 24/06/2024 - 8756899505SG *** LKK REF:
CD/AIG24060217/Apa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We have reviewed the insured driver’s passport, foreign driving license and SG arrival card and the insureds policy.
Coverage is confirmed, kindly proceed with DS.

Thank you.

Belveen Singh (Ben Singh)

AIG

Pronouns: He/Him/His

Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1881
belveen.singh@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 3, 2024 3:43 PM

To: Tarnjit Singh, Belveen Singh <Belveen.Singh@aig.com>

Cc: Tam, Ivan-WK <lvan-WK.Tam@aig.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Case Assignment TP - SMQ7536G - 24/06/2024 - 8756899505SG *** LKK REF:
CD/AIG24060217/Apa3

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Sirs,
We attached herewith a copy of insured driver’s passport, foreign driving license and SG arrival card.

Our insured driver is holding foreign driving licence as he is entering into Singapore on 17 June 2024 for
holiday/travel.

Please advise if there is any policy issue and whether we can proceed DS. Thanks.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead
Third Party Direct Settlement
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tarnjit Singh, Belveen Singh <Belveen.Singh@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, June 28, 2024 3:29 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Tam, Ivan-WK <lvan-WK.Tam@aig.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Case Assignment TP - SMQ7536G - 24/06/2024 - 87568995055G *** LKK REF: CD/AIG24060217/Apa3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Kindly assist to contact the producer : ALL INS AGENCY PTE LTD at 96992282

Thank you.

Belveen Singh (Ben Singh)

AlG

Pronouns: He/Him/His

Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1881
belveen.singh@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, June 28, 2024 2:33 PM

To: Tarnjit Singh, Belveen Singh <Belveen.Singh@aig.com>

Cc: Tam, Ivan-WK <lvan-WK.Tam@aig.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Case Assignment TP - SMQ7536G - 24/06/2024 - 87568995055G *** LKK REF:
CD/AIG24060217/Apa3

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Dear Sir / Madam,

No contact information provided, we also unable to contact insured.

Please advise.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Tarnjit Singh, Belveen Singh <Belveen.Singh@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, June 28, 2024 2:12 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Tam, Ivan-WK <lvan-WK.Tam@aig.com>

Subject: RE: Case Assignment TP - SMQ7536G - 24/06/2024 - 87568995055G

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above captioned.
We are unable to verify the validity of our insured drivers licence.

Please assist to contact the insured to obtain the drivers NRIC and Drivers Licence or to do an addendum on the GIA
report if the information is incorrect.

Thank you.

Belveen Singh (Ben Singh)

AlG

Pronouns: He/Him/His

Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10

Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1881
belveen.singh@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2024 2:40 PM

To: Tarnjit Singh, Belveen Singh <Belveen.Singh@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Case Assignment TP - SMQ7536G - 24/06/2024 - 87568995055G

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

This mail is associated with :
*SMQ7536G (8756899505SG)
[SNL6622L]
TP
SRISHTI CHHABRA
Jun 24 2024 8:00AM
[MONICA JOHAN @ MONICA]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
Dear Tarnjit Singh, Belveen Singh,

Please note that a claim has been assigned to you for handling in Merimen. For your action and follow up please.
This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this email.

Sent by : Merimen Administrator (MERIMEN TECHNOLOGIES (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.)
IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emailin error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
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copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is
the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any
loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emailin error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is
the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any
loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emailin error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is
the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any
loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



