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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: WIN AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES <winautomotiveservices@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 February 2025 2:58 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: AFTER PAINT PHOTO FOR VEHICLE NUMBER: SLS1034D

Dear Huey Yon,  

 

We accept the offer lump sum amount of $4,500.00 with 7 repair days. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Best regards,  

 

RACHAEL 

Yours sincerely, 

Rachael Soo 

Workshop Admin 

Win Automotive Services Pte Ltd  

H/P No: +65-88539084 

Address: 60, Jalan Lam Huat, Unit 04-53, Singapore 737869. 

 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, February 7, 2025 11:41 AM 

To: WIN AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES <winautomotiveservices@gmail.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: AFTER PAINT PHOTO FOR VEHICLE NUMBER: SLS1034D  
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Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

Without prejudice 

  

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump sum $4,500.00 with 7 days of repair, subject to their approval. 
  
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 
  

From: WIN AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES <winautomotiveservices@gmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2025 4:40 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: AFTER PAINT PHOTO FOR VEHICLE NUMBER: SLS1034D 

  

Dear,  

  

Hereby attached the after paint photo as per your request. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Best regards,  

  

RACHAEL 

Yours sincerely, 

Rachael Soo 

Workshop Admin 

Win Automotive Services Pte Ltd  

H/P No: +65-88539084 

Address: 60, Jalan Lam Huat, Unit 04-53, Singapore 737869. 


