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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2024 7:33 PM
To: Swee Hian Lee
Cc: AutoInsure; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Subject: OUR REF SLU5228A ECICS TP CLAIM FINALIZE

Hi Ether, 
 
My apologies for the typo error. 
 
Finalize $2759.00 (P/P, before GST). 3 days.  (Subject to insurance approval) 
 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Steven Foong| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Swee Hian Lee <SweeHian.Lee@autoinsure.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2024 6:39 pm 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OUR REF SLU5228A ECICS TP CLAIM FINALIZE 
 
Dear Steve, 
 
Should be $2759.00 before gst and 3 working days right? 
 
 
 
 
Thank you 
 
Regards,  
Ether Lee 
Claims Estimator 
Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145. 
Tel: +65 3157 2621 
Mobile: +65 9743 6363 
www.inchcape.com 
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From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, October 22, 2024 6:25 PM 
To: Swee Hian Lee <SweeHian.Lee@autoinsure.com.sg> 
Cc: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: OUR REF SLU5228A ECICS TP CLAIM FINALIZE 
 
Hi Ether, Kindly refer our finalize $2752. 00 (P/P, before GST). 3 days. (Subject to insurance approval) Ple ase confirm. B est Regards, Steve Chen| Automotive Assess or LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,  
 

Hi Ether, 
 
Kindly refer our finalize $2752.00 (P/P, before GST). 3 days. (Subject to insurance approval) 
 
Please confirm. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Swee Hian Lee <SweeHian.Lee@autoinsure.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2024 4:35 pm 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg> 
Subject: OUR REF SLU5228A ECICS TP CLAIM FINALIZE 
 
Dear Steve, 
 
Attached here before paint photo ,supplier invoice and supplementary report. 
 
Kindly let us have you finalize amount soon. 
 
 
 
 
 
Thank you 
 
Regards,  
Ether Lee 
Claims Estimator 
Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145. 
Tel: +65 3157 2621 
Mobile: +65 9743 6363 
www.inchcape.com 
 

 
 


