Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, October 11, 2024 12:00 PM

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Monica Chung

Subject: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C10032183/MC || OI-SJK179S (OTHER) TP-YP5028H || Ests:
$0.00 || KT MOTORWERK

Attachments: C10032183 YP5028H.zip

Dear Team,

We would like to request TP survey for YP5028H. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop:

John Tee,
HP:93287487
KT MOTORWERK

ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 5489978

Please confirm assignment.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Chang Shi Qian
Executive, Claims Administration

T +65 6989 3707
E shigian.chang@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 11:51 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Monica Chung <monica.chung@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: REQUEST SUPPORTING EVIDENCE || PRI REQUEST 11.10.2024 || C10032183/MC || ACCIDENT
INVOLVING YP5028H AND SJK179S ALONG JALAN BESAR ON 10.10.2024

Dear Team,
We would like to appoint LKK.
Below is the attached Scene photo for your references.

Thank you.

Regards,

John Tee,

HP:98287487

KT MOTORWERK

ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 11:04 am

To: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Monica Chung <monica.chung@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST SUPPORTING EVIDENCE || PRI REQUEST 11.10.2024 || C10032183/MC || ACCIDENT INVOLVING
YP5028H AND SJK179S ALONG JALAN BESAR ON 10.10.2024

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

Please be informed that our insured has yet to report the accident. Kindly let us have the supporting
evidence.

Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Chang Shi Qian



Executive, Claims Administration

T +65 6989 3707
E shigian.chang@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 10:19 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: REQUEST GIA REPORT || PRI REQUEST 11.10.2024 | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5028H AND SJK179S
ALONG JALAN BESAR ON 10.10.2024

Dear Team,
Below is the attached GIA.

Thank you.

Regards,
John Tee,



HP:98287487
KT MOTORWERK
ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 10:08 am

To: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST GIA REPORT | | PRI REQUEST 11.10.2024 | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5028H AND SJK179S ALONG
JALAN BESAR ON 10.10.2024

Dear John,

We refer to your email on 10.10.2024.

Please let us have your client’s GlA report, for our claim registration.
Please take note ourinsured has yet to report the accident.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Chang Shi Qian
Executive, Claims Administration

T +65 6989 3707
E shigian.chang@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
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confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 6:55 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP5028H AND SJK179S ALONG JALAN BESAR ON 10.10.2024

To the officer in charge,

We are the appointed workshop for YP5028H. The other party SIK179S (BUDGET
DIRECT)

Please arrange for inspection at the following address:

KT MOTORWERK
ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978

Once the date and time is firm, please inform us and look for John Tee, 98287487
during the inspection.

Regards,

John Tee,

HP:98287487

KT MOTORWERK

ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978



