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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Sent: Friday, 25 October 2024 10:11 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: logeswaran chandra; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: COR FINALISATION FOR SBS3363J - ALREADY SURVEYED ON 11/10/2024

Dear Rasul  
We agree with COR P/P $23,110.12 before GST with 08 working days. 

 
Thank You 

 

 

 

Best Regards 

 
Manager, Claims 
Mobile   +65 9199 0025 
Email     bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg 

 

 

 

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, October 25, 2024 9:59 AM 

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 

Cc: logeswaran chandra <logeswaran.chandra@towertransit.sg>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: COR FINALISATION FOR SBS3363J - ALREADY SURVEYED ON 11/10/2024 

 

[EXTERNAL EMAIL]  
Hi Lynn, 

 

As per our message, 

 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $23,110.12 /- with 08 days of repair before GST, subject to 

their approval. 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards,  
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Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
1

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2024 11:41 am 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: logeswaran chandra <logeswaran.chandra@towertransit.sg> 

Subject: COR FINALISATION FOR SBS3363J - ALREADY SURVEYED ON 11/10/2024  

  

Hi Rasul 

Please find attached and kindly finalise soonest. 

Also please forward us the marked estimate. 

  

Thank You 

  

  

  

Best Regards 

 

Manager, Claims 

Mobile   +65 9199 0025 

Email     bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg 
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, October 15, 2024 3:07 PM 

To: logeswaran chandra <logeswaran.chandra@towertransit.sg> 

Cc: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 

Subject: Re: ESTIMATE FOR SBS3363J - ALREADY SURVEYED ON 11/10/2024 

  

[EXTERNAL EMAIL] 

Hi Logan, 

  

received with thanks 

  

  

Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  
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From: logeswaran chandra <logeswaran.chandra@towertransit.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, 15 October 2024 2:33 pm 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 

Subject: ESTIMATE FOR SBS3363J - ALREADY SURVEYED ON 11/10/2024 

  

Dear Rasul, 

  

Attached estimate copy.  Please provide us the marked copy. 

  

Rgds,Rgds,Rgds,Rgds, 

Logan 

Claims Executive 

Email  : logeswaran.chandra@towertransit.sg 

  

 

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd 

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170 

Registration number 201419417K 

www.towertransit.sg 

  

  

[Security Reminder] This email was sent from outside the organisation - please use 
caution when clicking on links or opening attachments. 
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