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Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, October 9, 2024 10:34 AM
To: admin-d; SUR; assignments
Cc: Monica Chung; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Rick Teo; Claims
Subject: TPPD PRS: Claim ref: C10032140/MC || OI- SFZ1130T (Silver) TP-SCZ6866G|| Est: 

$0.00 || AutoBay Pte Ltd
Attachments: C10032140 SCZ6866G.zip

Hi Team,  
 
We would like to request TP PRS for SCZ6866G.  TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle. 
 
Workshop informaƟon:  
Address: 

 
 
Please confirm assignment.   
 
Thank you. 
  
Warmest Regards,  
 
Lan Boon Chin 
Executive, Claims Administration 
 
T +65 6989 3695 
 

 
 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 
239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance. 
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or 
privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this 
communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 

From: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 9 October 2024 9:19 am 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: PRS Request on 08.10.2024 || C10032140/MC || RE: PRI FOR SCZ 6866G ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFZ 
1130T ON 3.10.2024 OUR REF: CL/241016/T/AB 
 
Dear Sir (Without Prejudice) 
 
We refer to your email. 
 
Our client is agreeable to LKK. Thank you. 
 
Regards 
Sally Goh 
(For and on behalf of Catherine Lim )  
Catherine Lim LLC 
(Advocates & Solicitors) 
12 Eu Tong Sen Street,  
#05-172, The Central (SOHO 2)  
Singapore 059819 
Tel: 64385500 
(UEN & GST Reg No. 201310922k) 
 

From: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 October 2024 1:14 pm 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: PRI FOR SCZ 6866G ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFZ 1130T ON 3.10.2024 OUR REF: CL/241016/T/AB 
 
Dear Sir (Without Prejudice) 
 
Please find attached GIA. Thank you. 
 
Regards 
Sally Goh 
(For and on behalf of Catherine Lim )  
Catherine Lim LLC 
(Advocates & Solicitors) 
12 Eu Tong Sen Street,  
#05-172, The Central (SOHO 2)  
Singapore 059819 
Tel: 64385500 
(UEN & GST Reg No. 201310922k) 
 
 

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 October 2024 12:52 pm 



3

To: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: PRI FOR SCZ 6866G ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFZ 1130T ON 3.10.2024 OUR REF: CL/241016/T/AB 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sirs,                                            
 
We refer to your email on even date. 
 
Please let us have your client’s GIA report as our insured has yet to make the accident reporƟng. 
 
Thank you. 
  
Warmest Regards,  
 
Lan Boon Chin 
Executive, Claims Administration 
 
T +65 6989 3695 
 

 
 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 
239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance. 
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmiƩed with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidenƟal and / or 
privileged informaƟon. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communicaƟon to 
others and noƟfy the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
Please consider the environment before prinƟng this e-mail. 
 

From: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 October 2024 11:20 am 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: PRI FOR SCZ 6866G ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFZ 1130T ON 3.10.2024 OUR REF: CL/241016/T/AB 
 
Dear Sir 
 
RE: NOTICE TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO PRE-
ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NON-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLAIMS (NIMA) 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCZ 6866G / SFZ 1130T ON 3.10.2024 ALONG MCE  
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We are instructed by TAN POH CHIN LAURENCE to noƟfy you of a road traffic accident involving our 
client’s vehicle No. SCZ 6866G and vehicle No. SFZ 1130T driven by your insured/driver at the material 
Ɵme.  
 
As a result of the accident, our client’s motor vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to 
repair the damaged motor vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this noƟce 
whether you/your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the motor vehicle. If we do not 
receive any reply from you/your insurer within the sƟpulated Ɵmeline, our client shall proceed to repair 
the vehicle without further reference to you. 
 
Please let us know your appointed surveyor.  
 

Name of Workshop : AutoBay Pte Ltd 

Address of Survey LocaƟon : 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
#02-11 Autobay @Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 

Name of Contact Person :   MR LIM 
 86186116 

 
Regards 
Sally Goh 
(For and on behalf of Catherine Lim )  
Catherine Lim LLC 
(Advocates & Solicitors) 
12 Eu Tong Sen Street,  
#05-172, The Central (SOHO 2)  
Singapore 059819 
Tel: 64385500 
(UEN & GST Reg No. 201310922k) 
 
 
 


