Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 23 December 2024 10:24 AM

To: Zoey Kian Zhi Yeu

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FINALIZED DIRECT SETTLEMENT: SNM693R & SHD3034S D.0.A:29/09/2024
Hi Zoey,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $48,791.94 /- with 10 days of repair before GST, subject to
their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

From: Zoey Kian Zhi Yeu <zoey.kian@wearnes.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 December 2024 4:13 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Khong Beng Hwee <kenneth.khong@wearnes.com>; Chan Yau Chiang
<yauchiang.chan@wearnes.com>; Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>; Jodie Lee Khar Nee
<jodie.lee@wearnes.com>

Subject: FINALIZED DIRECT SETTLEMENT: SNM693R & SHD3034S D.0.A:29/09/2024

Hi Rasul,
See attach for final bill.
Thank you.

Zoey Kian
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

V 45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 91294556
www.wearnesauto.com  zoey.kian@wearnes.com

WEARNES



