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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 18 October 2024 10:12 AM
To: service@kkimhin.com.sg; SUR
Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhong@gmail.com; simon@kkimhin.com.sg; 

survey@kkimhin.com.sg; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: GBH 3919 P - estimate-DOA: 10/9/2024 
Attachments: GBH 3919P mark est_compressed.pdf

Dear Sandra, 
 
 
Please be informed that According to insurance, they will be repudiating liability for failing to maintain the 
insured vehicle in an efficient and road-worthy condition. 
 
As such, they are unable to indemnify the own damage claim. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Veron Chen | Case Handler 
Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 9 October 2024 10:04 AM 
To: service@kkimhin.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhong@gmail.com; simon@kkimhin.com.sg; survey@kkimhin.com.sg; Kenneth 
Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: GBH 3919 P - estimate-DOA: 10/9/2024  
 
Dear Sandra, 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Attach surveyor mark estimate. 
 
Vehicle Not Authorise repair. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Veron Chen | Case Handler 
Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 7 October 2024 5:13 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: GBH 3919 P - estimate 
 
Hi  
fyi 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: service@kkimhin.com.sg <service@kkimhin.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 7 October 2024 5:09 PM 
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhong@gmail.com; simon@kkimhin.com.sg; survey@kkimhin.com.sg; Admin A 
<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: GBH 3919 P - estimate 
 
Dear Kenneth 

Thank you for surveying the vehicle today GBH 3919 P. 
 
Enclosed the estimate for your adjustments. Please email to us. Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
Sandra 
6452 7018 
9622 2116 
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd 
 


