Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 October 2024 9:38 AM

To: Admin A; Rajes (LKK Auto); assignments

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: OUR REF: 23/24/24/vC05/029893 GBH 3919 P (DOA: 10 Sept 2024)
Attachments: GlAReport 3919.pdf

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Rajes,

Please assist on OD survey email below.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Eric Woo

Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

————— Original Message-----

From: service@kkimhin.com.sg <service@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 4 October 2024 5:17 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; 'Sandra (Gmail)' <sandrakhong@gmail.com>; simon@kkimhin.com.sg;
survey@kkimhin.com.sg

Subject: GBH 3919 P (DOA: 10 Sept 2024)

Dear Officer

Enclosed the GIA report for GBH 3919 P DOA: 10 Sept 2024.

Vehicle was recently towed out from police compound and estimate is still in preparation.
Can you kindly appoint surveyor first for our coordination once estimate is ready?

Thank you.

Best Regards
Sandra



6452 7018
9622 2116
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd



