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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2024 1:50 PM
To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT'
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VP05/029979  Accident Involving Vehicle No. SLW770Y / 

SCY35H On: 07/10/2024 *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24100119/Xpa3 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that third party has no video footage. 
 
We would like to seek approval to reject third party claim based on BOLA 31. Third party was turning out from slip 
road and collided with our insured who was driving straight. 
 

 
For your review and approval please. Thanks. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
 

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 2:01 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VP05/029979 Accident Involving Vehicle No. SLW770Y / SCY35H On: 07/10/2024 *** 
LKK REF: CD/LPC24100119/Xpa3  
 



2

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
Attached both parties GIA report for your easy reference. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 11:23 am 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OUR REF: TBA/SCY35H Accident Involving Vehicle No. SLW770Y / SCY35H On: 07/10/2024 *** LKK REF: 
CD/LPC24100119/Xpa3  
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our 
necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 7 October 2024 3:14 PM 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: OUR REF: TBA/SCY35H Accident Involving Vehicle No. SLW770Y / SCY35H On: 07/10/2024 
 
Dear Eric, 
 
Thank you for the email. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Hueh Yin | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, October 7, 2024 2:58 PM 
To: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: OUR REF: TBA/SCY35H Accident Involving Vehicle No. SLW770Y / SCY35H On: 07/10/2024 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Rajes, 
 
PRI email below FYNA. 
 
Our insured yet to report accident. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
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Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Apple Sim <apple.autounited@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 7 October 2024 1:16 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Auto United <autounitedsg@gmail.com> 
Subject: Accident Involving Vehicle No. SLW770Y / SCY35H On: 07/10/2024  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Our ref : SLW770Y 
Your ref : SCY35H 
 
Hereby attached our client soft copy accident report for your refencene. 
Please arrange LKK Auto to come survey vehicle no.SLW770Y 
Thank you. 
 
 
***Please take note, our company address will no longer be at Bartley Biz Centre. From 1 
April 2024, we will move to 
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

#01-92, Autobay@Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 
 
Regards , 
Apple 
AUTO UNITED SG PTE LTD 
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 , 
#01-92 AUTOBAY@KAKI BUKIT 
SINGAPORE 417883  
Tel : 6844 1184 / 9657 2134 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 


