From: Nordin Bin Mohammad <nordin.mohammad@hyundaimotors.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2025 3:15 PM

To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Heng Swee Hee <shheng@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Foong Yao Jie (Jack) <Foong.Yao@hyundaimotors.com.sg>;
Terence Mun Jia Hui <terence.mun@hyundaimotors.com.sg>

Subject: RE: MSFCIL Ref: D24008728MFCT/CTPL/JY/TPD-2 | | OUR REF: Hyundai loniq AE Hybrid - SMG6179M - TP
claim / Your ref: Hyundai loniqg AE - SHB6396M ***LKK Ref: CD/FCI24100115/Rma3

Dear Daphne,

We accept as per offer amount . Refer below bank details , email notification can send to my email .

Payment via Account transfer:
Bank: DBS Bank Ltd

Bank code: 7171

Branch code: 001

Bank account number: 0010626370

Payment via Paynow:
Paynow UEN: 195609283RVEH

Paynow via Paynow QR:
LLAH L A B

L




Company Name KOMOCO MOTORS PTE LTD

Company Reg Mo. 199609283R

Address 253 ALEXANDRA ROAD, #01-01, SINGAPORE 159936
Contact No.

Bank Transfer Details

Beneficiary KOMOCO MOTORS PTELTD

Bank Mame DBS BANK LTD

S 12 MARINA BOULEVARD, DBS ASIA CENTRAL AT MARIMNA BAY
FINANCIAL CENTRE TOWER 3, SINGAPORE 018982

Bank Code 7171

Branch Code 001

SWIFT Code DBSSSGSG

Bank Account No. 001-062637-0

Currency S5GD

Remittance Attention To
Email / Contact Mumber

Thanks You.

Warmest Regards,

Nordin Bin Mohammad
Vehicle Assessor Officer, Service

KOMOCO MOTORS PTELTD

253 Alexandra Road

#01-01 Singapore 159936

Email nordin.mohammad@hyundaimotors.com.sg
HP (65) 86998507

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2025 3:00 pm

To: Robyn Chin Zhi Shen <robyn.chin@hyundaimotors.com.sg>

Cc: Foong Yao lJie (Jack) <Foong.Yao@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Heng Swee Hee <shheng@hyundaimotors.com.sg>;
Nordin Bin Mohammad <nordin.mohammad@hyundaimotors.com.sg>

Subject: RE: MSFCIL Ref: D24008728MFCT/CTPL/JY/TPD-2 | | OUR REF: Hyundai loniq AE Hybrid - SMG6179M - TP
claim / Your ref: Hyundai loniqg AE - SHB6396M ***LKK Ref: CD/FCI24100115/Rma3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (W/GST) $3,734.34
2. Loss of Use (3 days x $50.00) $ 150.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 2.18




