Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, October 4, 2024 8:44 AM

To: assignments; admin-d; SUR

Cc: Caleen Yit; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Rick Teo

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10032072/CY || Ol- SMU5814X (Grey) TP-SNK4246H || Est:
$0.00 || KY AUTO PTE. LTD.

Attachments: C10032072 SNK4246H.zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for SNK4246H. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:
Address:

[ a=1-1 I:I.'!-IIEHI Wy

Raymond

KY AUTO PTE. LTD.

25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#05-23 SYNERGY@KB
SINGAPORE 417800
Tel: 80288693

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Lan Boon Chin
Executive, Claims Administration

T +65 6989 3695
E boonchin.lan@budgetdirect.com.sg
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance.

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or
privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this
communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: KY AUTO PTE LTD <kyclaimsg@outlook.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2024 8:12 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; KY AUTO <kyautosg@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 03.10.2024 | | C10032072/CY || RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNK4246H AND YOUR
INSURED SMU5814X ON 02/10/2024

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Dear All,

Kindly assign LKK to carry out pre-inspection for this vehicle.

Thankyou.

Best Regards,
Raymond

KY AUTO PTE. LTD.

25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#05-23 SYNERGY@KB
SINGAPORE 417800
Tel: 80288693

From: KY AUTO <kyautosg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2024 3:10 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: kyclaimsg@outlook.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNK4246H AND YOUR INSURED SMU5814X ON 02/10/2024
Importance: High

Dear All,



Kindly assist in the liability clearance for above mentioned case. We propose for a 100% direct
settlementin our client's favour.

Attach here are the GIA report for your reference.

Please advise who is the officer in-charge we shall liaise with.

To avoid dispute during finalization, we propose for LOU/LOR at $180/$250 per day.

Attach here are the GIA report for your reference and we will sent you the estimate once it is ready.

Also, please let us have a list of 10 surveyors.

Please take note, our client is going to submit medical bill separately against your insured .

Thankyou.

Best Regards,

Raymond

KY AUTO PTE. LTD.
25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#05-23 SYNERGY@KB

SINGAPORE 417800



Tel: 80288693



