
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
59 Loyang Drive Singapore 508969

www.cdge.com.sg

Company Registration No: 199506048W

Yours sincerely
Kazali H S
CDGE Claims Department
DID: 62148736 FAX: - Email: kazali@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer-generated letter. No signature is required.

A copy each of the following supporting documents marked [X] is enclosed:

[X] Original Repair Bill [X] Letter of Authority from Owner/Hirer/Operator
[X] GIA/Police Report(s) [X] Rental Rate Letter
[ ] LTA/GIA Search Slip(s) [X] Downtime/Mileage Record
[ ] Survey Report / Bill [ ] Witness Statement / Accident Scene Photo(s)
[ ] Driver's IC/DL/VL / Road Tax / Log Card / Certificate of Insurance
[ ] Tow Chit / PIR / Hirer's IRAS / Others :

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our clients' claims as soon
as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any
personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 03.10.2024 INVOLVING SH 7765M & GBK9634E ALONG SIMS PLACE

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd , the owner of vehicle
No SH 7765M, which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle No
GBK9634E.

The vehicle owner and the taxi hirer/driver concerned have requested and authorised us to assist
them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters arising
from the damage of the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driver, we are submitting these
claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants:

Attn : Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice

LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD
300 BEACH ROAD #17-04/07
Singapore 199555

Our Ref: CT1024/SH 7765M/KS(st)
Date: 29.10.2024

Taxi Owner's Claim :
1. Cost of Repairs
2. Loss of Rental 7 days x S$ 114.97
3. Survey Report Fee
4. LTA Search Fee
5. GIA / Police Report Fee
6. Others

Hirer's Claim :
1. Loss of Income 7 days x S$ 80.00
2. Others

[E&OE] Total Claims

S$ 3,433.50
S$ 804.79
S$ 0.00
S$ 0.00
S$ 2.18
S$ 0.00

S$ 560.00
S$ 0.00
----------------------------
S$ 4,800.47









Our Ref: CT24100048

Date: 22 October 2024

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 03/10/2024 @ 14:10 hrs
ALONG SIMS PLACE
INVOLVING GBK9634E

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717           Mainline +65 6555 1188           Facsimile +65 6453 3183





INSURER ENQUIRY

Find
insurer
Vehicle reg. no.

GBK9634E

Date of Accident

RESULT & RECEIPT

Payment details
Request Amount: S$2
GST Amount: S$0.18
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive): S$2.18

General Insurance Association
Records Management Centre
GST Registration No: M400017735

03/10/2024

Reset

TP Insurer Enquiry

Insurance Lonpac Insurance Bhd

Period of Insurance 27/01/2024 - 26/01/2025

Requested By Huang Xiao Yan (COMFORTDEL…

Requested Date 03/10/2024 15:51

.......................................................................................................

........................................................................

................................................................

.....................................................................................................



1

Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, 13 December 2024 6:26 PM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: ORef: 24/24/24/VC05/029973 - LONPAC - SH 7765M AND GBK9634E N 

03.10.24 ***LKK Ref: CD/LPC24100097/Tma3

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Hi Daphne, 
 
Thank you for the checking. 
 
Please proceed to offer as follows: 
 

 
COR & GST 
 

3,433.50 3,433.50 

LOR ($114.97 x 7d) 
 
LOI ($80 x 7d) 
 
 

804.79 
 

560.00 

689.82 (114.97 x 6d) 
 

300.00 (50x 6d) 
 

Insurer search fee 
 

2.18 2.18 

Total  
 4,800.47 4,425.50 

 
Thanks 
Huey Ni 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2024 5:37 pm 
To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: ORef: 24/24/24/VC05/029973 - LONPAC - SH 7765M AND GBK9634E N 03.10.24 ***LKK Ref: 
CD/LPC24100097/Tma3 


