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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Zena Lim Puay Chin <ZenaLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 5 June 2025 10:37 AM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: Emily Tan Su Min
Subject: RE: (Our Ref: D24008727MFCT/CTPL) SMX3899Z & SHB6166K (DOA: 02/10/2024) 

*** LKK REF: CD/FCI24100089/Ema3

Dear Daphne,  

Kindly proceed to settle as follows:  

MSFC Mandate 

Cost of Repair   $ 15,693.50 $ 15,693.50 

Loss of Use ($50 x $60/day x 
9 to 10 days   

 $ 450.00 $ 600.00 

GIA Search Fee (Exclude 
GST first) 

$ 2 $ 2.18 

Total $ 16,145.50 $ 16,295.68 

 
 
Thank you. 
 
Zena Lim 
Motor Claims Department  
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Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. 
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. 
If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system  
and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 
From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 3 June 2025 5:21 pm 
To: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Motor Claims 
<MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: (Our Ref: D24008727MFCT/CTPL) SMX3899Z & SHB6166K (DOA: 02/10/2024) *** LKK REF: 
CD/FCI24100089/Ema3 

 


