Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@misfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, October 1, 2024 1:46 PM

To: assignments

Cc: Lim Gan Koon (Chris); serene@limyewboo.com

Subject: FW: D24008620MFCT SGY4673S & SHA1542X ALONG PIE TOWARD CHANGI ON
30.09.2024

Attachments: LTA receipt-20240930-123351.pdf; SGY7643S GIA REPORT.pdf; 7434bc48-

f90e-432b-b156-287baadfb09b.jpeg; b9f337e0-b76a-4e49-
bcef-38ba77a00ccd.jpeg; e4696941-94cf-4f3e-bd50-5799f8f8a28¢.jpeg;
MT00018224 is Approved; MSA.pdf

Dear Sirs,
Enclosed documents for survey.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Harminder Kaur

Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

TEL : 6359 1800 | FAX : 6223 0541 |
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sq

A Member of LEEE Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom
itis intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please
delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Serene Lim <serene@limyewboo.com>

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2024 5:15 PM

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: SGY4673S & SHA1542X ALONG PIE TOWARD CHANGI ON 30.09.2024

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links,
opening attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.

To : Motor Claims Dept ~ (Arrangement of Surveyor Unit)

RE: NOTICE TO THIRD PARTY INSURERS TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKINGS DAY
PURSUANT TO PARAGRAPH 6.2 OF PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NON-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLAIMS (NIMA)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGY4673S & SHA1542X ALONG PIE TOWARD CHANGI ON 30.09.2024
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We are the repairer for Seah Jie-Wei, Shaun the owner of vehicle no. SGY4673S.
Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at the following venue:
Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co

Blk 10, Sin Ming Industrial Estate, #01-10, Sector C, Singapore 575645

Tel: 64534177 Fax: 64593724 Email: serene@limyewboo.com

Contact Person: Serene Lim Hp : +65 96852332

Please also provide us a list of 10 surveyors as your nominated SJE (Single Joint Expert)

PLEASE ARRANGE OFFICER-IN-CHARGE TO LET US KNOW ASAP IF WE COULD DO DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR THIS CASE

I/ We enclosed herewith a copy of our client SAS Statement for your reference. Looking forward to your kind
assistance and co-operative in this matter.

Please note that if you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 days excluding any intervening
Saturday, Sunday or Public Holiday, the said workshop will commence repairs thereafter without further reference to
you

Regards

Serene LIM

Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co
Direct : +65 64545011
Mobile : +65 96852332



