Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2024 5:30 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP LIBERTY / SNQ8996T - After Repair & Finalisation

Dear Shiau Chan,

P/P $1,465.45 /- with 03 days of repair before GST accepted. Should we submit LOD to you?

Thank you.
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HP : (65) 8666 7775
Office-Tel : (65) 66310707
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This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom
it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or
use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 20, 2024 4:43 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM
Subject: RE: TP LIBERTY / SNQ8996T - After Repair & Finalisation

Dear Rachel,

Any status as below email?

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2024 12:17 PM



To: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: TP LIBERTY / SNQ8996T - After Repair & Finalisation

Hi Rachel,
As per our message,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $1,465.45 /- with 03 days of repair before GST.

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM <CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM>
Sent: Monday, 7 October 2024 11:48 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: TP LIBERTY / SNQ8996T - After Repair & Finalisation

Dear Mr Rasul,

With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle, attached herewith the after repair photos for your
reference.

We’ve also attached herewith our calculations, please let us have the finalised cost of repair.

Thank you.

Rachel Lai | claims Department Cw {ES:E JMP'J'ESEIWEB’:‘Z;

B ody wor ks

HP : (65) 8666 7775
Office-Tel : (65) 66310707



Reporting Centre & Workshop

5 Soon Lee Street
#01-60, Pioneer Point
Singapore 627607
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b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.

This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom
it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or
use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.



