Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Lim Yan Shi Jenn <jenn.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, April 8, 2025 3:23 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Coco Lu Ting; Loi Ai Ting

Subject: FCI / TP Claim / CIT / Our ref: SLN4224D Your ref: SHA8733R DOA: 29.09.2024
Attachments: 08042025151813-0001.pdf

Dear Sir,

Attached our repair invoice, Car Rental Invoice, and letter of authorization for your perusal.

Our client’s claim is as stated below:

COR $ 11,859.20
LOR $ 1,438.80 $130.80x 11D
$ 13,298.00

Kindly offer for settlement

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jenn Lim (Ms)

@@ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
TEL: 6568 4693 F: +65 6565 1240 « www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

v . . -
t;g:f A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any
attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this emailin error, please notify us immediately by
return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender,
and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



To:

@@ ! Exceptional lourneys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage France Pte. Limited (“Cyg¢le & Carriage”)
209 Pandan Gardens,
Singapore 609339

Attention: [Motor Claims Department]

LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

Dear Sirs,

1.

IMWe, the undersigned, am the registered owner of vehicle no. SLN4224D (vehicle no.} (the
“Vehicle”).

As a result of & motor incident occurring on 20/09/2024 (date and time of accident) onfatong BLK
254, ADMIRALTY BR. 5750354 betwsen the Vehicle and SHA8733R (3 party vehicle(s) number,
if any) (the "Accident”), the Vehicle was damaged and has been seni in for repairs to be conducted
at Cycle & Carriage's workshop.

-

IMWe hereby authorize Cycle & Carriage to act for and on my/our behalf in respect of the following:

(a) to submit, make, settle and/or resolve any claims (the “Claims”"} which ifwe may have
against third party insurers and/or any other parties (“Third Parties”} arising out of the
Accident, in any manner as it deems fit;

{b) to receive payment from any Third Parties as settlement for the Claims (including accepting
cheques made aut in favour of Cycle & Carriage); and

{c) to generally do or cause to be done all acts or things (including signing any forms or
documents or giving instructions to any Third Parties) which it deems necessary or
expedient for the foregoing purposes.

In addition fo the above, YWe hereby further authorize Cycle & Carriage, for and on our behalf, to
execute and sign any discharge vouchers, indemnity forms and/or any other forms or
documents in relation to or arising from the Claims.

For the avoidance of doubt, all payments towards settlement of the Claims should be made in
favour of Cycle & Carriage.



] @@ ‘ Exceptional lourneys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

I/We further acknowledge and recognize that any settlement which Cycle & Carriage may make for
and an my/our behalf in respect of any Claims may be on a without prejudice basis and without any
admissicn of liability in so far as any other Third Parties are concerned.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully,

Vi

Name: YUE ZHENG
NRIC / Passport No. / Company Registration No.: 613D




MS ‘ FirstCapital MS First Capital Insurance Limited
www.msFirsteapital.com.sg

AMarmber of INSURANCE BROUP (UEN 195000106C GST Regq. No, M2-0001 676-9)
DISCHARGE RECEIPT
—— A REMEIE

CLAIM REFERENGCE - D24008611MFCT

ACCIDENT DATE : 28/09/2024

ACCIDENT LOGATION : 354D ADMITALTY DR MSCP

INSURED :CITYCAB PTE LTD

INSURED DRIVER :YAP CHYE KHOON

INSURED VEHIBLE  : SHAS733R SIGNED WITHOUT PREJU DICE FOR

i ' ANY PERSONAL INJURY CLAIM
INVOLVED PARTY 1 SLN4224D
SETTLEMENTSUM  : $1 2,513.20
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

TAX INVOICE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE FRANCE PTE. LIMITED

PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 809339 Tel: (65) 64732792

CITRCEN

Comparyy Reg No. 200608327M
GET Reg No. MR-8500111-X

Invoice Name & Address

Cwner Name & Vehicle Info

MS FIRST CAPITAL TINSURANCE LIMITED

Cust No/Name FCY02758/YUE ZHENG

Reg No/Reg Date SLN4224D J 03/05/2017
MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Date in/Mileage 10/01/2025/ 65517
g;’i\EELES QUAY Chassis/Package YF73ABHZTGJB79640 J#CPP
SINGAPORE 048580 Engine No 10JBHD 3069277
Contact No 65073848 Make/Model CIT/GCAP 1.6 BLUEHDI EATS INTENSIVE ML
HIIHIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIII\IIIIIIII\IIIIIlIHIII\IIIHIIIIII!IIIII\IIIIIHII\IIIIIIII!IIIII e S SRS T e o
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed Qperator WIP No Invoice/Credit Note No
FFX00001 Credit 05/04/2025/ 12:36 TLL 260 / AiTing 10473 77000801
Description of Goods / Services Qty Unit Price  Disc% Amaount
E PNT88000 1800.00
TO REPLACE FRT BUMPER, FRT LHS FENDER, HEADLAMP,
REPAIR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA
E PNT98000 1100.00
PAINT WORK ON FRT BUMPER, FRT LHS FENDER
M SUNDRY 100.00
ANTI-RUST PROOFING
M SUMDRY 100.00
APPLY BODY SEALANT ON AFFECTED AREA
A 54900099 80.00
TO CHECK WIRING & CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 480.00
TG CARRY OUT DTAGNOSTIC CHECK ON ELECTRONIC CONTROL SYSTEM
M SUMDRY 50.00
SUNDRIES
S SPECIALISTJOB 85.00
TO SUPPLY FRONT LICEMSE PLATE WITH FRAME
X FRONT BUMPER 1.00 1739.00 0.00 1739.00
X BUMPER BRACKET 1.00 457.00 0.00 457.00
X BUMPER MOULDING 1.00 251.00 .00 261.00
X BUMPER MOULDING 1.00 380.00 (.00 380.00
% GUARD GRILLE INFERIEUR 1.60 519.00 0.00 519.00
X BRACKET SET 1.00 181.00 0.00 181.00
X BRACKET SET LAT 1.00 181.00 0.00 181.00
% ABSORBERS SET 1.00 137.00 0.00 137.00
X BUMPER BRACKET 1.00 358.00 0.00 358.00
X FRONT WING LH ASS 1.00 731,00 0.00 731.00
X BMPR RUBBR BOOT 1.00 373.00 0.00 373.00
¥ HEADLIGHT ASSY LH 1.00 1063.00 0.00 1063.00
X BUMPR DEFLECTOR 1.00 535.00 0.00 535.00
X RIVET 4,8X20 10.00 8.00 0.00 80.00
7 TEXT
TP CLAIM CDG SHAB733R

Payment should be made strictly by NETS, credit cards or PayNow (via QR code or UEN) only. Thank you.
Any dispute to the invoice must be made within 3 days. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required,

Page 1of 2
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

TAX INVOICE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE FRANCE PTE. LIMITED

PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 Tel: (65) 64792792

CITROEN

Company Reg No. 200809327
GST Reg No. MR-8500111-X

Invoice Name & Address

Owner Name & Vehicle Info

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

Cust No/Name

FCV02758/YUE ZHENG

Reg No/Reg Date SLN4224D / 03/05/2017
MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTHENT Date In/Mileage 10/01/2025/ 65517
SZP;JTEELES QA Chassis/Package VF73ABHZTGJ879640 /#CPP
SINGAPORE 048580 Engine No 10JBHD3069277
Contact No 65073848 Make/Model CIT/GCAP 1.6 BLUEHDI EAT6& INTENSIYE ML
Colour/Trim WPP BLANC BANQUISE / IXF YATAGO GREY
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No Invoice/Credit Note No
FFX00001 Credit 05/04/2025/ 12:36 TLL 260 / AiTing 10473 77000801
Description of Goods / Services Qty Unit Price  Disc% Amount
DOA : 29.09.24
SURVERYOR  TAUFIKH  30.10.24
05 REPAIR DAYS
Guarantee Your Warranty, Maintain with Cycle & Corriage!
Parts 6,985.00 Nett 10,880.00
Labour 3,560.00 9% GST on 10380.00 979.20
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 85.00 Total Payable 11,859.20
Diagnostics Job 0.00 Paid 0.00
Sundry/Cthers 250.00 Total Due 11,859.20
Total({w/o GST) 10,880.00

Payment shouid be made strictly by NETS, credit cards or PayNow (via QR code or UEN) only. Thank you.
Any dispute to the invoice must be made within 3 days. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.

Page 20f 2



B K W RENT A CAR PTELTD
UEN/GST No.: 2001062760
120 Lower Delta Road #02-15 Cendex Centre

Si 169208
RE "T"A'BAH T:I:giggrse’/387777 Fax: 6738 6666

& subsidiary of BKW Automobile Pre Ltd

Website: hitps://bkw.sg

TAX INVOICE
Inveiced To Invaice Number P 15530
CYCLE & CARRIAGE FRANCE PTE Invoice Date 23/01/2025
LIMITED Due Date 23/01/2025
HIRER : YUE ZHENG VHA Number P 15930
3538 ADMIRALTY DRIVE Vahijcle Number SLF4761L
#12-286
SINGAPORE 752353
5/N  Description No. of Days Rate Amount
1 RENTAL FROM 10 JANUARY 2025 TO 21 JANUARY 2025 11 120,00 1,320.00
YOUR REF: SLN 4224 D
Subtotal 1,320.00
GST @ 9% 118.80
Total {incl, GST) 1,438.80
Less: Payments -
Amount Due $51,438.80

Account Mame: BKW RENT A CAR PTELTD

Account No: 118-312-9991 Paynow UEN: 200106276D

Bank: UNITED OVERSEAS BANK LTD {UOB])

Branch: UDB Shaw Centre Branch

Bank Address: 1 Scotts Road #03-04 Shaw Centre Singapare 228208
gank Code: 7375 Branch Code: 018 Swift Code: UOVBSGSG

All chegues must be made payable to BKW RENT A CAR PTE LTD,
* please indicate the invoice nurmber and vehicle number in the reference.

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required,




120 Lower

BK

) ;;‘:_,REHT'—B:E '

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

¥

Name (as in ¥C)

NRIC/Passport No:

Address: 2 L. 2 j 7 }?’ Y] 21 [/ Aee
DJ{]V’E' '/2*.::&6 st—TA 2 _/3

Namg & Address of Employar

Qccupallon Driving Exp:

D/L Type: LocalfintiOthers: -~ .

T

“AUTHORIZED DRIVER'S PARTICULARS
Nama {as in IiC)

NRIC/Passport No:— Date of Birth:

Address; Age:
5( )

Creeupation Qiiving Exp: s

BKW RENT A CAR PTE LTD
Daltz Road #02-15 Cendex Cenlre Singapore 169208 Tel 6738 7777 Fax; 6271 1661
. ACRA No: 20-0106276-0 G5T-Reg. No: 20-0106276-D

24 HOQURS HELPLINE : 6223 1122

_VEHICLE H)RING AGREEMENT

A/BMS /P,

wane: 15930
cc £r6

=,

LT

Workshop: ...

Driving Licence No: — Passed Dats:{ o m ﬂ‘//m 2 0 {

oriving Lisence No: RN =zzc: eic Dote:

l\_DJ'L Typs: Local/Inti/Clhers:

Contact No: - e

-

INDICATE:
A - Actidents
0 - Dents

S - Scralches
X - Crack

I have read and agree to tie terms and condilion on both sides of this

agreement. I | have presented a charge/credit card for payment. | agree thal all amounls
payable under this agreement and for:parking and iraflic infringements may be billed to thal accourt and my signature abave will be considered to have been
\made on the chargefcradit card voucher. All information | have’ been -given

(‘Hirer's Own Vehicte No: & £ Al 452 i D Replace Veh No:

Loan Vehicle No: - __‘F 4 7—’5 [ L_ ;‘\\!H No:

Make & Model: H \\\/{_}(y’ Aurofianual Group:

CHARGES b : 3 cts

Daily (! day @$ in i, Perday RSN
Weekly/Monthly week @% Per week/Monthly

‘Others )
{E%Dwmm @3 Per day/Monthly
Delivery/Collection Sve

. / GS8T

OR No (> /& (A} SUB-TOTAL "

Peirol Level | (3T |- E . 1/4 i] . )1!2/ 34 F

Surc:arge IN A

0 Return the same petrot level GST i S A
First km FREE per day :
Lo e e TOTAL CHARGES | 4.5 )

NON WAIVER EXCE 20004
ACCESSORIES CHEUK—H
O bata Cards O Camera Systems [ Hub Cap

O Jack O Tyre Opener

0 Radio / CD Cartridge
Q Petrol Cap (1 Spare Tyre

S [ /L,

Hires! Sign_?a_'lure :

Additional Driver's Signature :

D

*Please refer to point §

B Rent A '_C_ar Pte Lid in connection with This agreemen! is true.j,

[ IMPORTANT _ _ _
1. The Hirer 3nd e suthorized driver by BKW must ba ovar 23 ysars of age and
under 70 yeors and be holding valid driyiit-licens es and have a minimum of
2 years regular 3nd qualifiod driving Experiency. Faliure to observe ‘stlpulation
may seturn ail damages costs to be Sorae by the Hirerftha Aulivorised Driver,

7. Al vehicles are suppliad with patral and should raturned wilh petrd! tevel tkewisa.

A service charge of $10 on top of a pekel surcharge is payablo by the hirer

should ke fail o reluim B vebicle al the spprapriate pefrottevel, ) .

Na refurd for early relun of wehicle, The Sirer shall ue liatle for agdlional charges

{ar any late return sl the rate shoswriper heur per day. indlusive of CDW andlor PAI

whgre applicable. Any relums afler our oparation hours will be charged as a il

dav rental

4. Use of Lhe venicle for Hlagal purpose [For instance: in connection with theft.
drug peddling or trafficking. smuagling, ilegal racing). is Strictly probibited,

5. Viehicta sirictly for Singapare uso only and may rol be driven aut of Singapore
withtout prior writlep eansent of BKW Rent A Cas Ple tid. The hirer is lable for s
ponally fea of minbrun $200 in additional te the appropfiate insurance top.apin
lhe case of non-disclosura of Malaysio usage. :

B. Tha hirer andfor driver shall be responsible for alt damayes or losses Dowsatver
caused, all irafiic violatlons, fings shd penaliies imposed on the yehicle for
whatsoever reagon it respost of of in connection wilh it's usa or gperation.

7. The hirer end/or dnvet shalt he responsibie for i claims damages, losses,
ingrzased iNSUIENCE PremILms, non-wavier excess and cos! expenss {inciuding

[

legal cosis on 2 fulf indemnily basis), Whalgoever an niwsoever broughl Jgains,
suifared or incured by you In respect of 1he vehicle of i use or Me operalicn ar the
vehicta. Full excess amount have o be paid immaiately in e eventl of 2n asciden!
The owner reserve the rght pol toreplace an eplacement vahicia if 20 accident
-pecurred, Any dafnade to the carwlll berepair al BIOW authorized worksnop
8. Smoke or permil smoking and transporl af pets in the vehicls ace not allowed. Ay
offersive sraali e g. cigaretie, dudan or pev's smell, the hirer anddor driver shalf cear
the cosl of rernoving the offensive senell of pel's lur botwean 5350 - 5500
9 The Hirer agrees (hat @ punclired tyre, emply patrol 1ank. 1953 of vehicle's key ar
logked kays inside of vehicle, by itseli, does ot consliule « bieakdown and ihal
in e event the owner's 24-Hours Emargancy Service is called upon to respond to
such oocLirenes, thir Hirer shall bear the cos! of such rasnonse A 560.00 per trip
10, Ity case of accidenl, the hirer shall report. Lo rental ofics immediately. An scaizant
eopont musl Le made within 24 hours. Failure lo comply. Hre hirer will uave (o bome
all iabitly fror all panins claim. Pl excass amotnt have b be paicd immediaely
‘e event of an accideni. .
. The hiar/Driver also have the-responsiiiily 1o ensurs hat the radator waler feved
in the car iz sulficient and do.nol dive winen the vehiche is stall and goss mel have
_ sufficient waler. Any damage-to Ihe engine will he bear by e hireridrivar
12, M) eustomers” data will be kep! strily confidenlini and i solely used for the
‘purpase of completing the sales iransactions and olhar refalisg maliers
+3. | understand and agrag 1o the personal data coflecion statement statad an e

1

vy

Dale Cut Time Out Mileage Check By

Remarks

;
!
o

Lo/i [2d 69157 29494909 WIK.

\CEDLAF CC B

Pt .
"Hirer's/Driver Signaturs

Terms and Condilions Page. v
\ é
s N

¢~ Refurn Of Yehicle: 1he Hirer Drivar [s Reguired To Sign

In The Column "Signature Of Rirer Driver Failing Which The Day And Time Insorled Below Shall Be Deemed To Be The
Day And Tima The Vehicle Is Relurmed To BKW Rent A Car Pte Ltd And The Same Shall Be Accepted As Conclusive Evidence Of The Same And Shall Not Be Challenged Or
Queskoned On Any Account Whatsoever, And | had cleared my balonging ltems [rom the reptal vahicle {(casheard, parking caupons, etc)”

g
<

Cate In Time In Mileage LhadkBy

X

Remarks

NS

U NS

TN 27T WS

“: . U‘_(.n'

1
VA
\ )( \Aw g
{rlirar/Diiwer. Signature




Direct Transfer

Name Of Payee

Cycle & Carriage France Pte Ltd

Bank Account Number

01-0-209985-5

Mame Of The Bank

Standard Chartered Bank (Singapore) Limited

PayN

ow - Individual Parea

""NRIC Number Or Mobde number

PayN

ow - Corporate Payee

** UEN number Or UEN wath suffix

200609327M




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, April 16, 2025 10:49 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: [SEEK MANDATE] - D24008611MFCT Our REF: CC24090510 SHA8733R Accident on
29/09/24 || CCS REF: SLN4224D *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24100008/Tpa3

Attachments: LKK SURVEY REPORT & PHOTOS.pdf; SLN4224D LOD.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please proceed and offer as per below:

COR -$11,859.20
LOR - $545.00 - $763.00 ($109.00 X 5D-7D)
Total — $12,404.20 TO $12,622.20

Thank you

EMILY TAN
Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg
Auemmarm:'-;:::.:imw:‘[ GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice:

This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please
delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 April 2025 3:49 pm

To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - D24008611MFCT Our REF: CC24090510 SHA8733R Accident on 29/09/24 || CCS REF:
SLN4224D *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24100008/Tpa3

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.

Your ref: D24008611MFCT
Our ref : CD/FCI24100008/Tpa3qg2(N)



Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA8733R(MS FCIL) AND SLN4224D(TP) ON 29/09/2024

We refer to the above matter.

We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour as he collided onto third party vehicle parked

vehicle (in parking lot).

We seek your approval to offer repairer “CYCLE & CARRIAGE FRANCE PTE LTD" at $12,622.20(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amount Revised
Claimed
1. Cost of Repair (with GST) $ 14,808.74 $11,859.20(510,880.00 + 9%GST)

2. Loss of Rental (11days x $120.00)(with GST) |$ 1,438.80 S 763.00(7days x $100.00)(+9%GST)

Total | $ 16,247.54 $12,622.20

Surveyor recommended 5days for repair + 1Saturday + 1Sunday = 7days.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 24/03/2025 is only for mandate purpose.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@Ilkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, November 18, 2024 11:02 PM

To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: D24008611MFCT Our REF: CC24090510 SHA8733R Accident on 29/09/24 | | CCS REF: SLN4224D *** LKK

REF: CD/FCI24100008/Tpa3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed for your perusal is:

. TP estimated cost of repair
. Preliminary advice



. Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Please note that our officer in charge is HT.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 1, 2024 2:10 PM

To: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: D24008611MFCT Our REF: CC24090510 SHA8733R Accident on 29/09/24 | | CCS REF: SLN4224D

Dear Harminder,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, October 1, 2024 1:25 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Lim Teng Keat <tengkeat.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg; Vikneswaran Naidu Ayavoo <vikneswarannaidu.ayavoo@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin
Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: FW: D24008611MFCT Our REF: CC24090510 SHA8733R Accident on 29/09/24 || CCS REF: SLN4224D

Dear Sirs,

Enclosed documents for survey.

Thank You.



Best Regards,

Harminder Kaur

Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

TEL : 6359 1800 | FAX : 6223 0541 |
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sq

A Member of Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete
the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Lim Teng Keat <tengkeat.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, October 1, 2024 9:55 AM

To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Vikneswaran Naidu Ayavoo
<vikneswarannaidu.ayavoo@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Our REF: CC24090510 SHA8733R Accident on 29/09/24 | | CCS REF: SLN4224D

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.

Dear Emily,

Please find attached documents for your perusal.

Thanks & Regards,

Lim Teng Keat

Customer Service Advisor

Claim Division Operation Body & Paint Centre
209 Pandan Gardens

@ @ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
Tel : +65 6568 4504 - DID: +65 6568 4531 »« Mobile: +65 9181 9978 « www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

- .
& A member of the jardine Cycle & Carriage Group




From: Fleet Safety <fleetsafety@cdgtaxi.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, October 1, 2024 8:22 AM

To: ctpl@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Cc: Lim Teng Keat <tengkeat.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Vikneswaran
Naidu Ayavoo <vikneswarannaidu.ayavoo@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit
<kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: Our REF: CC24090510 SHA8733R Accident on 29/09/24 || CCS REF: SLN4224D

This email was sent from outside of your organisation
Dear FCI Claims Team
Please assist with the email below.

Thank you.

Regards,
Carol Chen

Safety & Insurance (Fleet)
Hotline Contact No: 6550 8768
ComfortDelGro

#ComfortUnited, Together We Can Overcome

From: Lim Teng Keat <tengkeat.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2024 6:47 PM

To: SBST Claims Control <claimscontrol@sbstransit.com.sg>

Cc: Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Vikneswaran Naidu Ayavoo
<vikneswarannaidu.ayavoo@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Subject: THIRD PARTY CLAIM - CDG REF: SHA8733R / CCS REF: SLN4224D

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open
attachment unless you know the sender.

Dear Comfort Delgo,



Please find attached documents for your perusal.

Kindly advise Liability Clearance and surveyor assignment.

Thanks & Regards,

Lim Teng Keat
Customer Service Advisor
Claim Division Operation Body & Paint Centre

209 Pandan Gardens

@@ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339

Tel : +65 6568 4504 < DID: +65 6568 4531 « Mobile: +65 9181 9978 « www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

-
1? A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carr age Group

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any
attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this emailin error, please notify us immediately by
return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender,
and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us
and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is
not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a
binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement
signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to
print this only if necessary.

CityCab Pte Ltd Registration No. 199502839G

Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199303821R]

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any
attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by
return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender,
and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



	083be19c6b0ade48e5cd0e4aa2fea6cd7bc67578af8f33f36541a4eb1d6d7abb.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	7be4bb4591aa015fa81c3fbd12561b4520a342f4957d4e7cdc9b50217b8a31d2.pdf

	773d189cbc9dc3576067701ee0d358c5fa04e4840847c9092c0fb96bb5a842ad.pdf
	083be19c6b0ade48e5cd0e4aa2fea6cd7bc67578af8f33f36541a4eb1d6d7abb.pdf
	7be4bb4591aa015fa81c3fbd12561b4520a342f4957d4e7cdc9b50217b8a31d2.pdf
	7be4bb4591aa015fa81c3fbd12561b4520a342f4957d4e7cdc9b50217b8a31d2.pdf
	7be4bb4591aa015fa81c3fbd12561b4520a342f4957d4e7cdc9b50217b8a31d2.pdf

	5 x 7 in. (2)
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style

