Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 June 2025 10:19 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; SUR; MT Tan (KFS)

Subject: RE: PRI for GBL9995H - Our Insured: SG6344G on 25.9.2024

Dear Shiau Chan,

Thank you for the email.

Please note that our client has decided to revert to his own insurer for OD claim.
Please close the case at your end.

Thank you.

Regards,

Alice

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop
Tel:6747 9560

Fax:6748 1006

---------- Original Message -----------

From:"Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)" <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

To:alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>, "MT Tan (KFS)" <mttan@kanfs.net>
Cc:SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>, SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Sent:Wed, 18 Jun 2025 06:27:04 +0000

Subject:RE: PRI for GBL9995H - Our Insured: SG6344G on 25.9.2024

> Dear Alice,
>

> Kindly advise the status of GBL 9995H.

>

> If done for repair works, kindly send us the final bill for finalise.
>

> Best Regards,

> Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler

> Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



