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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 23, 2025 3:07 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029925   GBM444K & XE5224C - NOTICE TO INSURER TO 

CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS *** LKK REF: 
CD/LPC24090493/Apa3

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Our insured vehicle damages is on the rear right whilst third-party vehicle damages is on the 
front left as follow. 
 

 
 
Base on the above damages, it is unlikely that our insured filtered into third-party’s vehicle lane 
as per what third-party indicated in his GIA report. 
 
We are of the view that our driver’s statement is more accurate that third-party rear ended our 
insured vehicle and swerve right to hit into SMJ2927G. 
 
Hence, we regret that we are unable to reply with an offer. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 23 September 2025 1:23 pm 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029925 GBM444K & XE5224C - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR 
INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24090493/Apa3 
 

Caution: This email is from an external sender. DO NOT click links or open attachments if you do not recognize the sender.  

 
Dear Eric, 
 
Please be informed that no video footage from third party repairer. They have purchased a copy of SMJ2927G 
accident report which is consistent to their client’s report.  
 
In view of conflict report between insured and third party, please advise if we may consider resolving the 
matter at 50/50 or else advice further instruction. 
 
Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, August 27, 2025 6:33 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029925 GBM444K & XE5224C - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR 
INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24090493/Apa3 
 

Lonpac External - General 
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Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
As spoken, our insured indicated that our insured was driving straight when he felt a bump at 
the rear of his vehicle. 
 
Please let us have further evidence such as video footage to prove that our insured is negligent 
for this matter. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 8 August 2025 3:40 pm 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029925 GBM444K & XE5224C - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT 
PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24090493/Apa3 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Caution: This email is from an external sender. DO NOT click links or open attachments if you do not recognize the sender.  

 
Your ref: 24/24/24/VC05/029925 
Our ref : CD/LPC24090493/Apa3(N) 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE5224C(LONPAC) /GBM444K(TP) / OTHERS ON 26/09/2024 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
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Based on all parties’ accident report, we are of the view that BOLA 28(g) is applicable. 
XE5224C(OI)-> GBM444K(TP) -> SMJ2927G. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “TWINCAR AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" at $9,868.25(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
  

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair (with GST) $21,403.95 $ 9,047.00 ($8,300.00+9%GST) 
2. Loss of Rental (9days x $120.00)(with GST) $  1,177.20 $    763.00(7days x $100.00)+9%GST 
3. Loss of Us e(PRI -2days) $     200.00       - 
4. LTA/GIA Report Search Fee $       89.25 $      58.25 

Total $22,870.40 $ 9,868.25 
   
Surveyor recommended 5days for repair +1Sunday +1PRS = 7days. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 08/08/2025 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.  
  
 
 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Friday, September 27, 2024 4:42 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029925 GBM444K & XE5224C - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR 
INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24090493/Apa3 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
We attached all parties GIA report for your easy reference. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 27 September 2024 2:42 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: GBM444K & XE5224C - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 
WORKING DAYS *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24090493/Apa3  
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action. 
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Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 27 September 2024 11:30 AM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: GBM444K & XE5224C - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 
WORKING DAYS 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Hueh Yin | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Friday, September 27, 2024 11:21 AM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; TwinCar Automotive PL 
<claim@twincar.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: FW: GBM444K & XE5224C - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 
WORKING DAYS 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
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Dear Rajes, 
 
FYNA. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: TwinCar Automotive PL <claim@twincar.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 27 September 2024 11:10 am 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: GBM444K & XE5224C - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 
WORKING DAYS  
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
We appoint your surveyor company LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd. 
Kindly send assignment to your surveyor as soon as possible.  
 

Thank you 

 
 
 

Regards, 

Sandy 

TWINCAR Automotive Pte Ltd  

Direct line : 6932 4872 

Office : 6744 0510 

Workshop address : 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-17 Kaki Bukit Autohub Singapore 417921 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
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On Fri, 27 Sept 2024 at 10:52, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote: 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sandy, 

  

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and enclose the names 
of our Motor surveyor firms your attention:- 

  

1. Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd 
2. FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd 
3. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

  

Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days. 

  

  

Best Regards 

  

Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: TwinCar Automotive PL <claim@twincar.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 27 September 2024 10:41 am 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: GBM444K & XE5224C - NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS  

  

Without Prejudice 
 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

As per above subject. 
  
Please refer to attachment and:- 
  
Kindly propose / provide your 10 surveyors as soon as possible. 
  

Thank you 

  

  

Regards, 

Sandy 

TWINCAR Automotive Pte Ltd  

Direct line : 6932 4872 

Office : 6744 0510 

Workshop address : 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-17 Kaki Bukit Autohub Singapore 417921 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, October 14, 2025 8:25 AM
To: 'TwinCar Automotive PL'
Subject: RE: LOD of GBM444K (TWINCAR) - Accident Involving GBM444K & XE5224C ON 

26/09/2024 *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24090493/Apa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sandy, 
 
We have reviewed the matter, and we regret to inform you that we maintain our position as per email dated 
25/09/2025. 
 
Thank you.  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
From: TwinCar Automotive PL <claim@twincar.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, September 25, 2025 5:34 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: LOD of GBM444K (TWINCAR) - Accident Involving GBM444K & XE5224C ON 26/09/2024 *** LKK REF: 
CD/LPC24090493/Apa3 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Please find the attachment. 
 
Vehicle (C) indicated that vehicle (B) hit our vehicle thus causing our vehicle to hit them. 
 
Kindly reply to us. 

  

Thank you 

 



2

 
 

Regards, 

Sandy 

TWINCAR Automotive Pte Ltd  

Direct line : 6932 4872 

Office : 6744 0510 

Workshop address : 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-17 Kaki Bukit Autohub Singapore 417921 
 
 
On Thu, 25 Sept 2025 at 07:57, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Our insured vehicle damage is on the rear right whilst your client vehicle damage is on the front left as 
follow: - 

   

Based on damages, we are of the view that our driver’s statement is more accurate that your client rear-
ended our vehicle an swerve tight hit onto SMJ2927G. 

In view iof the above, we regret to inform you that we are unable to look into your client’s claim. Thank you.  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 

Third Party Direct Settlement 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: TwinCar Automotive PL <claim@twincar.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, April 25, 2025 10:56 AM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: LOD of GBM444K (TWINCAR) - Accident Involving GBM444K & XE5224C ON 26/09/2024 *** LKK REF: 
CD/LPC24090493/Apa3 

  

1st REMINDER 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Regarding the email below, we have not seen any updates on this matter. 

  

Could you please provide us with an update within the next 10 working days? 

  

Thank you for your time and attention to this 

  

  

  

Regards, 

Sandy 

TWINCAR Automotive Pte Ltd  

Direct line : 6932 4872 
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Office : 6744 0510 

Workshop address : 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-17 Kaki Bukit Autohub Singapore 417921 

  

  

On Mon, 9 Dec 2024 at 11:25, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

We acknowledge receipt of your email / LOD.  

Our respective case handler, Hsiao Tong will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Cheers to a Wonderful Christmas and a Happy New Year 2025 ! 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: TwinCar Automotive PL <claim@twincar.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 6 December 2024 7:26 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: LOD of GBM444K (TWINCAR) - Accident Involving GBM444K & XE5224C ON 26/09/2024 
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Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

We refer to the above subject. 

Attached LOD for your kind perusal. 

Kindly reply to us. 

  

Thank you 

  

  

  

Regards, 

Sandy 

TWINCAR Automotive Pte Ltd  

Direct line : 6932 4872 

Office : 6744 0510 

Workshop address : 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-17 Kaki Bukit Autohub Singapore 417921 
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