Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2024 2:02 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg; mikkilin@esteemperf.com.sg; SUR
Subject: Re: FINALISED SMU1093K

Dear Huey Yon

We agreed to close at $7718.35 before gst and 5 days

Thank you

E| B — Freundliche Griile / Best Regards
Jenny Chong

Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division

(E) jenny@esteemperf.com.sg

ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

HEADQUARTERS (SHOWROOM /
WORKSHOP)

385 Sin Ming Drive, Singapore 575718

(T) +65 6753 2112 | (F) +65 6451 0394

BRANCH (WORKSHOP)

176 Sin Ming Drive, Sin Ming Autocare
#01-14/15/16, Singapore 575721

(T) +65 6484 1221 | (F) +65 6484 7829

www.esteemperformance.com




WE KEEP YOU DPRIVING

OnTue, Oct 22, 2024 at 1:50 PM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Jenny,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $7,718.35 /- with 5 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 21 October 2024 2:49 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>; mikki lin <mikkilin@esteemperf.com.sg>
Subject: Re: FINALISED SMU1093K

Dear Kenneth

| double check with supplier that the list price & parts number as below:

Headlamp LH $1873.4 (81150-0DF00)

Front Bumper $761.8 (52119-0V932)

Front bumper lower Grille $377 (53112-0D540)
Front bumper tow Cover $126.1 (52721-0D290)
LHF fender $1162.50 (53802-0D100)

LHF fender undershield $262.1 (53876-0D661)

LHF rim $2687.3 (42611-0DES80)



Kindly double check

Thank you

Freundliche Griil3e / Best Regards
Jenny Chong

Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division

(E) jenny@esteemperf.com.sg

ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

HEADQUARTERS (SHOWROOM /
WORKSHOP)

385 Sin Ming Drive, Singapore 575718

(T) +65 6753 2112 | (F) +65 6451 0394

BRANCH (WORKSHOP)

176 Sin Ming Drive, Sin Ming Autocare
#01-14/15/16, Singapore 575721

(T) +65 6484 1221 | (F) +65 6484 7829

www.esteemperformance.com

WE KEEP YOU DRIVING



On Fri, Oct 11, 2024 at 9:07 AM Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Attach finalise for SMU 1093K, please check and confirm. Final amount subject to insurance
approval thanks.

From: jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 1:03 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>; mikki lin <mikkilin@esteemperf.com.sg>
Subject: FINALISED SMU1093K

Dear Kenneth

Pls refer to the attached.

Kindly confirm the finalised amount asap.

Thank you

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards
Jenny Chong

Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division

(E) jenny@esteemperf.com.sg

ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

HEADQUARTERS (SHOWROOM /
WORKSHOP)

385 Sin Ming Drive, Singapore 575718




(T) +65 6753 2112 | (F) +65 6451 0394

BRANCH (WORKSHOP)

176 Sin Ming Drive, Sin Ming Autocare
#01-14/15/16, Singapore 575721

(T) +65 6484 1221 | (F) +65 6484 7829

www.esteemperformance.com

WE KEEP YOU DRIVING



