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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2024 10:37 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team
Subject: FW: YN6965G and SBS8068D TP Claims, Date of Accident 24/09/2024 along Tuas Ave 9 

(Junction of Tuas Ave 12)

  

From: Amencia A/P Albert Schweitzer <Amencia@goldbell.com.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2024 10:36:35 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: YN6965G and SBS8068D TP Claims, Date of Accident 24/09/2024 along Tuas Ave 9 (Junction of Tuas Ave 
12) 

Dear Mr Rasul, 
  
Offer acceptance. 
  
Thank you.  
  
  

 

Amencia A/P Albert Schweitzer  |  Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd  
 
 
m:  +65 9739 6452     

 

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

  
From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2024 10:03 am 
To: Amencia A/P Albert Schweitzer <Amencia@goldbell.com.sg> 
Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: YN6965G and SBS8068D TP Claims, Date of Accident 24/09/2024 along Tuas Ave 9 (Junction of Tuas Ave 12) 
  
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 
  
Hi Amencia, 
  
As per my message, 
  
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $1,850.00  /- with 03 days of repair before GST. 
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Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

  
  

From: Amencia A/P Albert Schweitzer <Amencia@goldbell.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, 30 December 2024 5:25 pm 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 
Subject: YN6965G and SBS8068D TP Claims, Date of Accident 24/09/2024 along Tuas Ave 9 (Junction of Tuas Ave 12)  
  
Dear Mr Rasul, 
 
Please assist confirmed finalised COR @ LS $1,874.00  (before GST) with 3 working days. 
  
Thank you. 
  

 

Amencia A/P Albert Schweitzer  |  Assistant, Motor Claims Admin 
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd  
 
 
m:  +65 9739 6452     

 

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

  


