Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: stephanie <stephanie@bhh.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 24 October 2024 10:59 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: mignon; raymond; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); stephanie
Subject: RE: FBM9515E_Finalisation

Hi Steve,

Thank you for your confirmation.
We will proceed to submit LOD.

Thank you and have a great day!
Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

Please avoid 1200hrs to 1330hrs for bike survey appointment.

Stephanie Gav

Sales Manager

Ban Hock Hin Co Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 Ext 250

Mobile: +65 9800 3299

Address: BLK 8 Defu South Street 1, #04-28 JTC Defu Industrial City, Singapore 533758

This mail and/or attachments are confidential and may also be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review,
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email and/or attachments is strictly prohibited. Please notify us immediately by email and delete this message and all its
attachments.
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From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 October 2024 9:35 am

To: stephanie <stephanie@bhh.com.sg>

Cc: mignon <mignon@bhh.com.sg>; raymond <raymond@bhh.com.sg>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FBM9515E_Finalisation

Hi Stephanie,

Kindly refer our finalize $2850.00 (L/S, before GST). 3 days. (Subject to insurance approval)

Please confirm.

Best Regards,



Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: stephanie <stephanie@bhh.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2024 3:04 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: mignon <mignon@bhh.com.sg>; raymond <raymond@bhh.com.sg>; stephanie <stephanie@bhh.com.sg>

Subject: FBM9515E_Finalisation

Dear Steve,

We appended below our final bill for your confirmation.

PParts -$ 2,948.00
Less : 10% -S 294.80
Total Parts -S$ 2,653.20
Labour -$ 1,100.00
Total -$ 3,753.20

Lump Sum - $ 3,000.00
3 days Repair

Please confirm.

Thank you and have a great day!

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

Please avoid 1200hrs to 1330hrs for bike survey appointment.

Stephanie Garv
Sales Manager

Ban Hock Hin Co Pte Ltd
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 Ext 250
Mobile: +65 9800 3299
Address: BLK 8 Defu South Street 1, #04-28 JTC Defu Industrial City, Singapore 533758

This mail and/or attachments are confidential and may also be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review,
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email and/or attachments is strictly prohibited. Please notify us immediately by email and delete this message and all its
attachments
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