
1

Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2024 11:02 AM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: PENDING FINALISE FOR VEHICLE : SLQ7241T

  

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2024 11:01:33 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Elite Automotive SG <elite.automotive13@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALISE FOR VEHICLE : SLQ7241T 

Dear Christy, 
  
Please submit the LOD to insurance company. 
  

Cheers to a Wonderful ChristmasWonderful ChristmasWonderful ChristmasWonderful Christmas    and a    Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025 !   

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 
  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2024 10:59 AM 

To: Elite Automotive SG <elite.automotive13@gmail.com>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: PENDING FINALISE FOR VEHICLE : SLQ7241T 

  
Hi Christy, 
  
Aside to Huey Yon, Kindly assist 
  
  

Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  
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From: Elite Automotive SG <elite.automotive13@gmail.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2024 10:57 am 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: PENDING FINALISE FOR VEHICLE : SLQ7241T  

  

Hi Rasul,   

  

  

  

  

We accept above offer-$7750.00 (Bf GST) and kindly let me know for the LOD is submit to insurer 

directly or to your office?  

  

  

  

Regards, 

  

Christy  

Elite Automotive P/L 

  

On Tue, 31 Dec 2024 at 10:53, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Samuel, 
  
As per my message to Christy, 
  
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $7,750.00  /- with 12 days of repair before GST, 
subject to their approval. 
  
  
  
  

Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

  
  

From: Elite Automotive SG <elite.automotive13@gmail.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2024 1:53 pm 
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To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: PENDING FINALISE FOR VEHICLE : SLQ7241T  

  

Hi 

 

Gently 2nd reminder that we're asking for finalisation. 

We are still pending finalisation for this case and not getting any response from your side. 

Kindly assist to proceed finalise this case as soon as possible 

Await for your quick response, thanks 

 

 Regards,  

Samuel 

Elite Automotive P/L 

  

On Fri, 6 Dec 2024 at 12:35, Elite Automotive SG <elite.automotive13@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Rasul 

 

Good day, Please kindly assist to proceed finalisation for this case,thank you 

  

--  

Regards,  

  

Elite Automotive P/L 

  

Tel : 6339 7378 

 

 

  

--  

Regards,  

  

Elite Automotive P/L 

  

Tel : 6339 7378 

 

 

  

--  

Regards,  

  

Elite Automotive P/L 

  

Tel : 6339 7378 


