Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2024 2:06 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SMF9036C TP REQUEST FINALISE

From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2024 2:05:43 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SMF9036C TP REQUEST FINALISE

Hi Taufikh,

We agree the total COR.

Thank You

Regards,
Ck Loh

Century Moftors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
Tel: +65 3157 2631

Mobile: +65 9743 6363

www.inchcape.com

@) Inchcape

inchcape.

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, October 2, 2024 1:00 PM

To: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMF9036C TP REQUEST FINALISE

Hi Ck,
Please refer attached, COR I/s $1300, 3 days.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh



Lkk Auto

From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 27 September 2024 5:44 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SMF9036C TP REQUEST FINALISE

Hi Taufikh,

We have attached the after paint photos and would like to finalise this case on lump sum basis.

Please let us have your offer soon.

Thank You

Regards,

Ck Loh

Claims Estimator

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
Tel: +65 3157 2631

Mobile: +65 9743 6363

www.inchcape.com
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