Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Taufikh
Noted on this

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Thursday, 26 September 2024 12:41 PM

Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Winnie Chai (via Google Drive); Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Re: Finalization FOR PC9719X

On Thu, Sep 26, 2024 at 12:39 PM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

LOD send to Strides.

Regards

Taufikh

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2024 12:38 pm
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Winnie Chai (via Google Drive) <connect3winnie@gmail.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

<veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Finalization FOR PC9719X

Hi Taufikh

OK. Please process.

Please advise LOD send to Strides or LKK?



Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Thu, Sep 26, 2024 at 12:33 PM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

COR $2135, 2 days.

Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2024 9:19 am

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Winnie Chai (via Google Drive) <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Subject: Finalization FOR PC9719X

Hi

Attached is the before paint and after repair photos.



Pls kindly revert on the finalization.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697



