Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Reporting (Charn's CustomCraft) <reporting@charnscustomcraft.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2025 11:43 AM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ***SPAM*** RE: FINALISED VEHICLE NO: SLW 3701 C. AFTER PAINT
Hi

I thought | send before CNY. Later let me check again

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676

Email: reporting @charnscustomcraft.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L

Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2025 10:52 am

To: reporting@charnscustomcraft.com.sg

Subject: ***SPAM*** RE: FINALISED VEHICLE NO: SLW 3701 C. AFTER PAINT

Dear Rina,
Any updates?

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933




From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 February 2025 11:35 AM

To: reporting@charnscustomcraft.com.sg

Subject: RE: FINALISED VEHICLE NO: SLW 3701 C. AFTER PAINT

Dear Rina,
Re-send
Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $1,070.00 with 4 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2025 1:29 PM

To: reporting@charnscustomcraft.com.sg

Cc: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALISED VEHICLE NO: SLW 3701 C. AFTER PAINT

Dear Rina,
Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $1,070.00 with 4 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.
Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 22 January 2025 5:19 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; reporting@charnscustomcraft.com.sg
Subject: FW: FINALISED VEHICLE NO: SLW 3701 C. AFTER PAINT

Dear Huey Yon,

FYNA-CS/SMR24090365/Rnp3e2

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Reporting (Charn's CustomCraft) <reporting@charnscustomcraft.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 January 2025 4:00 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: FINALISED VEHICLE NO: SLW 3701 C. AFTER PAINT

Hi Verron,

| send to Rashul. He says sent to you.

Tks
rina

Charn's Customcraft



Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676

Email: reporting @charnscustomcraft.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L

Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Reporting (Charn's CustomCraft) <reporting@charnscustomcraft.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 January 2025 1:12 pm

To: 'rasul@lkkauto.com' <rasul@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: FINALISED VEHICLE NO: SLW 3701 C. AFTER PAINT

Hi Rasul
See attached after paint photo
Only labour, rim repair and polish

Tks
Rina

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676

Email: reporting @charnscustomcraft.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L

Company Reg No: 25151300M




