Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 7 December 2024 3:59 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: ECICS | TP - SNE6444X - FINALIZE REPAIR

From: henry@mova.com.sg <henry@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 7 December 2024 3:58:39 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: nitha@mova.com.sg <nitha@mova.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ECICS I TP - SNE6444X - FINALIZE REPAIR

Dear Shiau Chan,
We are agreeable to your P/P COR offer at $1909.37, repair 03 days.

Thankyou.

Best Regards,

Hevwg Lee
Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Blk 1008 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-04/06/08

Singapore 159722

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltd

From: henry@mova.com.sg <henry@mova.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2024 6:36 pm

To: 'nitha@mova.com.sg' <nitha@mova.com.sg>
Subject: FW: ECICS | TP - SNE6444X - FINALIZE REPAIR

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2024 2:06 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; henry@mova.com.sg
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ECICS | TP - SNE6444X - FINALIZE REPAIR

Dear Henry,



WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Due to our surveyor calculation error, the repair cost should be $1,909.37 instead of $1,943.47 before GST.
Subject to insurance approval.

Cheers to a%dﬂd%{%é %&Wd and a Q(W Ve Zm 2025

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2024 9:51 AM

To: henry@mova.com.sg

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: ECICS | TP - SNE6444X - FINALIZE REPAIR

Hi Henry,
As per our message,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $1,943.47 /- with 03 days of repair before GST, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

From: henry@mova.com.sg <henry@mova.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2024 4:07 pm




To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Cc: nitha@mova.com.sg <nitha@mova.com.sg>
Subject: ECICS | TP - SNE6444X - FINALIZE REPAIR

Dear Rasul,

Good day to you.

Kindly refer to attach after paint photos for your review and seek your approval.

We would like to finalize P/P repair as below :

Part - $1675.70 + $397.90(Supp) > $2073.60 - $207.36(10%) = $1866.24

SIN - $0

Labor - $560.00

Total : $2426.24

Repair — 03 days.

Please assist us to expedite the finalization at your earliest convenience and hope to

receive your offer soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hevwg Lee

Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Blk 1008 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-04/06/08

Singapore 159722

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltd



