Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2024 3:00 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SLJ2786H HONDA SHUTTLE

From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2024 3:00:04 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLJ2786H HONDA SHUTTLE

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Taufikh,

We confirmed amount.
Please close the case.

Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2024 1:21 pm
To: Darren Ng

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLJ2786H HONDA SHUTTLE

Hi Darren,

Please refer attached, COR LS $2500, 3 days.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2024 10:38 AM



To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SLJ2786H HONDA SHUTTLE

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Taufikh,

FYNA

Based on estimate calculation:

COR @ $3000
DOR @ 3 Days

Kindly revise and get back to us on the finalize.

Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)



