Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 11:05 AM
To: Francis Cher TCBC

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SKN38M FINAL BILL

Hi Francis,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $13,193.40 /- with 05 days of repair before GST, subject to
their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth: Frint only wher necessary-

From: Francis Cher TCBC <francis.cher@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 7 October 2024 10:59 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SKN38M FINAL BILL

Hi. Rasul

Attached the above final bill for you to finalize.

Regards
Francis Cher

From: b050589 <francis.cher@borneomotors.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, October 7, 2024 10:57 AM

To: Francis Cher TCBC <francis.cher@borneomotors.com.sg>
Subject: Scan Data from FX-2F43FF
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