Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, April 8, 2025 5:14 PM

To: Lynn Khong (CTPIS); Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: OUR REF:BUS/09/24/5027(CHINATAIPING)- ACCIDENT ON 16.09.2024 INVOLVING SMB5016H
AND SLK985H ALONG BS:84529 (Blk 109) along Bedok North Ave 3

Attachments: SMB 5016H_LOD.pdf; LKK SURVEY REPORT & PHOTOS.pdf; Letter to Ol.pdf

Your ref: SNM24D205207/SLK985H/C02/KHONGLH
LKK ref : CD/CTI124090323/Tua3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK985H(CHINA TAIPING) / SMB5016H(TP)/ OTHERS ON 16/09/2024

We refer to the above matter.

We are of the view that liability is not in our driver's favour as he rear ended third party vehicle rear right portion.

We seek your approval to offer repairer “STRIDES PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD" at $3,409.18(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair $ 4,068.11 $ 2,507.00 ($2,300.00 + 9%GST)
2. Loss of Use (4days x $350.00) S 1,400.00 S 900.00 (3days x $300.00)
3. LTA/ GIA SEARCH FEE S 2.18 S 2.18
Total | S 5,470.29 $ 3,409.18

Surveyor recommended 2days for repair.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

Kindly note that this inspection report dated 26/03/2025 is only for mandate purpose.



Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Best Regards,
Yan
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Email: yan@lkkauto.com| DID: 6841-6051 | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lynn Khong (CTPIS) <lynn.khong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 5, 2025 9:51 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/09/24/5027(CHINATAIPING)- ACCIDENT ON 16.09.2024 INVOLVING SMB5016H AND SLK985H
ALONG BS:84529 (Blk 109) along Bedok North Ave 3

[Internal]

Dear LKK,
Please advise status.

Thank you

Regards,

Lynn Khong
Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Tel: (65) 6389 6116 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: A F-Jfiifs; Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Lynn Khong (CTPIS)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2024 4:35 pm

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: OUR REF:BUS/09/24/5027(CHINATAIPING)- ACCIDENT ON 16.09.2024 INVOLVING SMB5016H AND SLK985H
ALONG BS:84529 (Blk 109) along Bedok North Ave 3

Hi Mei Kwan,
Please find LOD email as below.

Thanks



| will be away from 12/12/2024 to 19/12/2024.
| have no access to the system.
For all matter, please email to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Regards,

Lynn Khong
Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6156 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: K >-fffifsk Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Karen Chan Siau Chin (StridesASvcs/Ins & Claims/Bus) <SiauChin.Chan@stridespremier.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 1 November 2024 4:24 pm

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Tan Wei Teck (StridesASvcs/Ins & Claims/Bus) <WeiTeck.Tan@stridespremier.com.sg>; Chong Fei Yuan
(StridesMSvcs/Finance/Fin Cont) <FeiYuan.Chong@stridespremier.com.sg>; Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (StridesASvcs/Ins &
Claims/Bus) <Balgish.Halil@stridespremier.com.sg>

Subject: OUR REF:BUS/09/24/5027(CHINATAIPING)- ACCIDENT ON 16.09.2024 INVOLVING SMB5016H AND SLK985H
ALONG BS:84529 (Blk 109) along Bedok North Ave 3

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs,

We claim on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number SMB5016H.
Your client's negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the
following losses:

Cost of Repair $2,507.00

Loss of Use $ 1,400.00 (4 days x $350.00/day)
Gears S 2.18

Total $3,909.18

We enclose the following documents,

1) Repair invoice
2) GIA Report
3) Gears Search



We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email.
Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Ltd.

Best Regards,
Karen Chan

Claims Department
Tel: 6556 3523

DISCLAIMER This electronic mail message and any files transmitted with it are intended exclusively for the
individual or entity to which it is addressed. The message, together with any attachment, may contain
confidential and/or privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, printing, saving, copying,
disclosure or distribution is strictly prohibited.If you, the reader are not the intended recipient, please do
not disclose, disseminate, circulate, copy or use any of the information contained in this email. Please
notify us immediately and delete the email and destroy any printed copy.



