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Address      
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Email & Contact Number 

 
    

 
Bank Transfer Details  

Beneficiary      
Bank Name      
Bank Address      
Bank Code        
Branch Code        
SWIFT Code      
Bank Account No.      
Currency SGD       

DICKSON AUTO CARE CENTRE PTE LTD
29 UBI ROAD 4, DICKSON AUTO CENTRE (S) 408619

admin@dacc.com.sg 
6668 1122

DICKSON AUTO CARE CENTRE PTE LTD

DBS
Raffles Place

7171

072

DBSSSGSG

072-021-5168
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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, November 19, 2024 7:59 PM
To: Yan (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: [MANDATE] - D24008112MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2) // SCE3656B
Attachments: LKK SURVEY REPORT & PHOTOS.pdf; TP LOD - SCE3656B.pdf

Dear Yan, 
 
Refer to your email, sorry for the late reply.  
 
You have our mandate to offer repairer “DICKSON AUTO CARE CENTRE PTE LTD" at $ 9,594.18(all-in). 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Serene Ler 
Motor Claims  
 
MS First Capital Insurance Limited  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
16 RaƯles Quay, #42-01 Hong Leong Building | Singapore 048581 |Reg. No. 195000106C 
: 6359 1814 | Tel: 6359 1800 | Fax: 6223 0541   
Motor Claims: motor_claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg  | Website:  www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal 
Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use 
any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 1:58 PM 
To: Aini Binte <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24008112MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2) // SCE3656B 
 
DIRECT SETTLEMENT 
 
 
Dear Aini, 
 
NEW TPD LOD - D24008112MFCT / 2 
 
RR done. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Chris Lim 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
D: 6359 1813 | M: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
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Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
  
Confidentiality Notice:  
This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you 
have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2024 9:36 am 
To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24008112MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2) // SCE3656B 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Your ref: D24008112MFCT 
Our ref : CD/FCI24090297/Uua3 
 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 7149Z(MS FCIL) AND SCE 3656B(TP) ON 13/09/2024 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
 
SHC 7149Z(OI) -> SCE 3656B(TP) -> SNE 6444X 

This is a 3 vehicles chain collision whereby our insured was the last vehicle. In accordance with the MCF guideline 
for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 

  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “DICKSON AUTO CARE CENTRE PTE LTD" at $ 9,594.18(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair  $ 25,328.59 $ 8,829.00 ($8,100.00+9%GST) 
2. Loss of Rental (7days x $100.00)+9%GST $      763.00 $     763.00 (7DAYS X $100.00) 
3. GIA / LTA search fee $          2.18 $         2.18 

Total $ 26,093.77 $ 9,594.18 
   
Surveyor recommended 7 days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 29/10/2024 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 
Yan 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Email: yan@lkkauto.com| DID: 6841-6051 | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2024 11:15 am 
To: 'DACC Mahirah' <mahirah@dacc.com.sg> 
Cc: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24008112MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2) 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
 
Dear Mira, 
 
We refer to your email below. 
 
Pls note that liability is clear but quantum to be agreed. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Chris Lim 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
D: 6359 1813 | M: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
  
Confidentiality Notice:  
This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you 
have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: DACC Mahirah <mahirah@dacc.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, September 18, 2024 11:05 AM 
To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Aini Binte <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: choonxiang@dacc.com.sg; junteo@dacc.com.sg; poon@dacc.com.sg; randellgoon@dacc.com.sg; 'SIEWYING' 
<siewying@dacc.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24008112MFCT/CCPL/TPD 2) 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Dear Sir/Madam,  
 

Our ref: SCE3656B_130924 
 
The survey has been done. We would like to check on the liability status please. 
 
Thank you, 
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MIRA 
Administration Officer 
 
Dickson Auto Care Centre Pte Ltd  
(A member of the Dickson Group)  
29 Ubi Road 4, Dickson Auto Centre, Singapore 408619 
T: 6668 1122 | F: 6668 1123 | E: mahirah@dacc.com.sg |24/7 Roadside Assistance: 6668 1129 
www.dicksongroup.com.sg 
 
DISCLAIMER: This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity 
named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that 
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original. Views expressed are those of the 
individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Dickson Group Pte Ltd and or any of its related corporations. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Aini Binte <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 16 September 2024 4:55 pm 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: choonxiang@dacc.com.sg; junteo@dacc.com.sg; poon@dacc.com.sg; randellgoon@dacc.com.sg; SIEWYING 
<siewying@dacc.com.sg>; 'DACC Mahirah' <mahirah@dacc.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24008112MFCT/CCPL/TPD 2) 
 
 
 
 
Insured Vehicle No : SHC7149Z 
TP Vehicle No      : SCE3656B 
Claim No           : D24008112MFCT 
Workshop Name      : DICKSON AUTO CARE CENTRE PTE LTD 
Our Surveyor       : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 
Instructions       : Direct Settlement 
(SUBJECTED TO QUANTUM TO BE AGREED) 
Created By         : AINI 
Verified By        : EMILYTAN 
Approved By        : CHRISLIM 
 
 
 
This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail. 
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