Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Importance:

Rasul (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 5 December 2024 2:45 PM

SUR; CS A Team

FW: FINALIZATION - SJJ 7207 D - AFTER PAINT AND SUPP

High

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2024 2:44:26 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FINALIZATION - SJJ 7207 D - AFTER PAINT AND SUPP

Hello Shiau Chan,

Can | know what you mean by invoice copy of LABOUR TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN?7?? This

one is labour job.

This is a hatchback car where the windscreen is stick with the bootlid. This is a standard procedure for

replacement of rear tailgate.

Thank you

Shavron Lee

Charn’s Customcraft « six 1010,
Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-105 (S)159724

% 62717054
1 charns@singnet.com.sg

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2024 2:07 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: FINALIZATION - SJJ 7207 D - AFTER PAINT AND SUPP

Dear Sharon,

Kindly provide us the invoice copy of LABOUR TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN.

Wondenful (lnistmas and =« Fappy Hew Year 2025

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler

Best Regards,



Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2024 12:12 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FINALIZATION - SJJ 7207 D - AFTER PAINT AND SUPP
Hi Sharon,

As per our message,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $5,950.00 /- with 05 days of repair before GST, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2024 4:32 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FINALIZATION - SJJ 7207 D - AFTER PAINT AND SUPP

Hi Rasul,
Kindly find attached for finalization.
Lumpsum @ $5970.00 (before GST), 5 working days.

Please confirm



Rina Chua

Charn's Customcraft

Blk 1010 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-105 (S) 159724

Tel: 62717054

Email: charns@singnet.com.sg




