Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Sherini,

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Friday, 18 October 2024 11:03 AM

Sherini Pillai

Admin A

Il REF: MPC2024D0010755 // LKK REF: CD/11124090270/Xpa3
I1_LKKINVOICE_SAC2401059.pdf

Please be informed that third party change workshop and did not arrange for survey.
In the view of the above, we will close the case in Merimen and bill for Merimen fee only.
Attached is a copy of Merimen fee invoice for your necessary action.

Thank you.

From: Accord Auto{Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2024 3:16 pm

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: [EXTERMAL] - Accident Involved: SNOB89504 & SMV1022K DOA 14.09.24

EXTERMNAL EMAIL - Thiz email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening [
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.

Secured by Chack Point

Dear Jacelyn

| would like to cancel the PRS, because customer claim at other workshop.

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Gen

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Mobile - (65) 9740 0999
Tel  : (65) 6481 9517
Fax : (65) 6481 9516

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use or
copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead
Third Party Direct Settlement
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)






