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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Suanne Chiu <suann@mova.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, August 25, 2025 12:48 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: FW: [OFFER] -MSFC Ref : D24007783MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & 

SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024
Attachments: 25082025124302.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Enclosed is signed DV, tax invoice & POA for your necessary action. 
 

Bank Account Name : MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD 
Bank Name : DBS BANK LTD SINGAPORE  
Bank Code : 7171    
Bank Branch Code : 006   
Bank Branch : Alexandra   
Bank Account No.: 006-011126-2  
PayNow UEN No. 198904033G   
Bank Swift Code : DBSSSGSG   

 
 
Thank you, 
 
Best Regards 
Suanne Chiu 
Claims Asst.Manager 
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: +65 6262 3377   
Fax: +65 62643151  
 

 
 

Connect with us on  
 
Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for delivery of the 
message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by 
reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be deemed as unless otherwise indicated 
by an authorized representative independent of this message. 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 4 August 2025 9:31 am 
To: Suanne Chiu <suann@mova.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: [OFFER] -MSFC Ref : D24007783MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Suanne, 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Kon Yin Siew <KonYinSiew@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, July 10, 2025 5:25 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Lim Gan Koon (Chris)
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - MSFC Ref : D24007783MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // TP CLAIMS - 

SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24090165/Rpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Pls offer as per below: 
 
COR - $2,406.72 
LOU - $150.00 to $180.00 ($50.00 to $60.00 x 3 days) 
GIA Fee - $2.00 to $2.18 
Total - $2,558.72 to $2,588.90 
 
Thank you. 
 
  
Yin Siew 
Motor Claims Dept. 
  
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 RaƯles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
D: 6359 1823 | M: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
  
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
  
Confidentiality Notice:  
This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If 
you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 3 July 2025 11:48 am 
To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - MSFC Ref : D24007783MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 
03/09/2024 *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24090165/Rpa3 
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EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Your ref: D24007783MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 
Our ref : CD/FCI24090165/Rpa3q2(N) 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA4751P(MS FCIL) AND SFJ2992A(TP) ON 03/09/2024 
  
We refer to the above maƩer. 
  
It is a head-to-rear collision. We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" at $2,588.90(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
  

Amount 
Claimed 

Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair (with GST) $ 4,912.63 $ 2,406.72 ($2,208.00 + 9%GST) 
2. Loss of Use (3days x $100.00) $    300.00 $    180.00 (3days x $60.00) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee  $        2.18 $        2.18 

Total $ 5,214.81 $ 2,588.90 
   
Surveyor recommended 3days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
Kindly note that this inspecƟon report dated 27/05/2025 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instrucƟon. 

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, June 23, 2025 1:51 PM 
To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: MSFC Ref : D24007783MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 *** LKK 
REF: CD/FCI24090165/Rpa3 
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Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We are pending LOD from third party to seek mandate. 
 
Thanks.  
 
Note: For future Email correspondence, please remove admin-a@lkkauto.com in your email. These 
email address admin-a@lkkauto.com is no longer in use.  

 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, June 23, 2025 1:48 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: MSFC Ref : D24007783MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 *** LKK 
REF: CD/FCI24090165/Rpa3 
 
Dear LKK, 
 
Please advise update on the survey report. 
 
Kindly note that the officer in-charge is Chris. 
 
 
 
Dear Chris,  
 
For your follow up. 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards 

Rachel Wu 

Motor Claims Dept 
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MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 RaƯles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building| Singapore 048581 
D: 6359 1812| Tel: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 | Reg. No. 195000106C 
Website http://www,msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA 
Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, 
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately 
by return e-mail. 

 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2024 11:23 pm 
To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: MSFC Ref : D24007783MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 *** LKK 
REF: CD/FCI24090165/Rpa3 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Hi Chris, 
We refer to the above maƩer. 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  
• TP esƟmated cost of repair  
• Preliminary advice 
• Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condiƟon 
Please note that our officer in charge is Hsiao Tong. 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin  
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, September 16, 2024 9:40 AM 
To: 'Enny' <enny@mova.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: MSFC Ref : D24007783MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 
Without Prejudice 
Dear Enny, 
We refer to your email below. 
Please note that liability is clear but quantum to be agreed. 
Thank you. 
Chris Lim 
Motor Claims Dept. 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
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16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
D: 6359 1813 | M: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice:  
This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you 
have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 
From: enny@mova.com.sg <enny@mova.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, September 14, 2024 11:35 AM 
To: admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: ***SPAM*** RE: D24007783MFCT : TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

Dear Sir/Madam, 
Please kindly revert the liability for this case.  
Thank you 
Best Regards, 
Enny Lee 
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 
Blk 1008 Bukit Merah Lane 3 
#01-04/06/08 
Singapore 159722 
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314 

 

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use its 
content. We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.  
Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to minimize 
this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.  
From: enny@mova.com.sg <enny@mova.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2024 5:20 pm 
To: 'admin-a@lkkauto.com' <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ***SPAM*** RE: D24007783MFCT : TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
Please kindly revert the liability for this case.  
Thank you 
Best Regards, 
Enny Lee 
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 
Blk 1008 Bukit Merah Lane 3 
#01-04/06/08 
Singapore 159722 
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314 
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This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use its 
content. We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.  
Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to minimize 
this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.  
From: nitha@mova.com.sg <nitha@mova.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2024 10:49 am 
To: 'Harminder Kaur' <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: 'Lim Gan Koon (Chris)' <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; enny@mova.com.sg; leongkeat.soo@mova.com.sg 
Subject: RE: ***SPAM*** RE: D24007783MFCT : TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 
Dear All  
Kindly assign LKK. 
Best Regards, 
Nitha 
Claims Officer  
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314 

 

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2024 10:45 am 
To: nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg> 
Cc: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: ***SPAM*** RE: D24007783MFCT : TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 
Resent. 
Thank You. 
Best Regards, 
Harminder Kaur 
Motor Claims  
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
TEL : 6359 1800 | FAX : 6223 0541 |  
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 
A Member of Insurance Group 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete 
the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

From: Harminder Kaur  
Sent: Monday, September 9, 2024 9:42 AM 
To: nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg> 
Cc: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: D24007783MFCT : TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
OUR REF: D24007783MFCT/CTPL/CL/TPD 
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YOUR REF: SFJ2992A 
Dear Sirs 
We refer to your survey request dated 6/9/2024. 
Please find below our list of surveyors for your reference. Kindly select from our list below and inform us of your 
choice within the next 2 days. 

1. Autoprobe Consultants 
2. Priority Services 
3. Vicom Ltd 
4. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Once you inform us of your choice, the surveyor will be appointed within 2 working days of your email. 
If you do not agree to any of the surveyors above, you may proceed to appoint your own surveyor. In this instance, 
we will also appoint a surveyor from our list above to conduct the PRI. Upon completion of repairs, please contact 
our appointed surveyor to conduct a physical re-inspection of the vehicle. 
Thank You. 
Best Regards, 
Harminder Kaur 
Motor Claims  
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
TEL : 6359 1800 | FAX : 6223 0541 |  
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 
A Member of Insurance Group 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete 
the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

From: nitha@mova.com.sg <nitha@mova.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, September 6, 2024 4:45 PM 
To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: leongkeat.soo@mova.com.sg; enny@mova.com.sg 
Subject: TP CLAIMS - SFJ2992A & SHA4751P ON 03/09/2024 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

Dear All,  
Kindly advise on the liability and assign surveyor. 
Thank you, 
Best Regards, 
Nitha 
Claims Officer  
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314 

 


	2d3d0a1994401f34dadfa114825bfcf9352a6c7c2a0d5d43bd653e2ab6f63295.pdf
	2d3d0a1994401f34dadfa114825bfcf9352a6c7c2a0d5d43bd653e2ab6f63295.pdf
	c6644ca6cf921faaa424d10b42dde4a1c53919969fd229f86f164e420806bad3.pdf
	2d3d0a1994401f34dadfa114825bfcf9352a6c7c2a0d5d43bd653e2ab6f63295.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style

