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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Anikka Lai SK <anikka.lai.sk@eurokars.com.sg>
Sent: Saturday, November 9, 2024 10:59 AM
To: Admin A; Yan (LKK Auto)
Cc: ESPL Claims Admin
Subject: LOD//TP - SGB17J TP CLAIM AGAINST SLQ3924H / DOA: 03/09/2024 *** LKK REF: CD/III24090130/Xua3
Attachments: LOD - SGB17J.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
 
Dear Yan, 
 
The repair of SGB17J has been completed. We submit the claims with the supporting documents for your reference. 
 

1) COR Invoice No. 50600386     $     4,409.05 
2) Loss of Use  : $150 x 5 days (4 working days + 1 PRI)     $        750.00 
3) LTA/GIA Search Fees     $          27.25   
4) Admin Fees     $        350.00 
5) Letter Of Authorization      ATTACHED 
6) Discharge Voucher      ATTACHED 

Please pay to Eurokars Auto Pte Ltd       $     5,536.30 
 
We look forward to receiving your offer/Discharge Voucher soon.    
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Warmest Regards. 

 
 
Anikka Lai (Ms) 
Claim Assistant Manager | Body & Paint   
 

 
To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
 
27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042 
Tel. +65 63310680 | DID +65 63310693 | Anikka.lai.sk@eurokars.com.sg 
 

                 
 
The contents of this email and attachments herein are strictly confidential. It may contain privileged information and is intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity to whom the email is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by replying to this message 
and then delete it from your system. Do not read, copy, use or circulate this communication. While every reasonable effort has been made to ensure that 
this communication has not been tampered with, <Business Entity> and its affiliates are not responsible for alterations made to the contents of this message 
without its express consent. Any individual or entity who communicates with us is taken to have accepted these risks. In providing personal data to us, you 
consent to us using it for the purposes set out in https://www.eurokarsgroup.com/data-protection/. 

 
 

 

From: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2024 2:08 pm 
To: Oh Hui Wen <huiwen.oh@eurokars.com.sg> 
Cc: ESPL Claims Admin <claims.espl@eurokars.com.sg>; Ahmad Faisal Bin Hamid <faisal.hamid@eurokars.com.sg>; Jerome 
Tan ZL <jerome.tan.zl@eurokars.com.sg>; Jason Wong <jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Jun Xian 
<junxian.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso <eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Manojj Baloo 
<manojj.baloo@porsche.com.sg>; Muhammad Nur Faiz Bin Sanat <faiz.sanat@porsche.com.sg>; Lee Yao Sheng 











 

Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
09 Sep
2024
11:59

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> CHARMAIN TIRTAMARTA @ CHARMAIN KWEE YAN LING. Claimant's I
D: -> SXXXX028J.

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

2
09 Sep
2024
11:59

Clm Veh Model
Changed (207636) BMW IX XDRIVE40 SPORTS LED PGR (A). [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

3
09 Sep
2024
11:59

Clm Created
Reg No: SGB17J. Acct Date: 2024/09/03. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India International Insur
ance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Eurokars Service
s Pte Ltd (Kung Chong)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
09 Sep
2024
11:59

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

5
09 Sep
2024
11:59

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2024/09/18 [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6
09 Sep
2024
11:59

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
09 Sep
2024
11:59

Label Added (30653):Direct Settlement. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

8
09 Sep
2024
11:59

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> MOHD RASUL [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

9
13 Sep
2024
13:11

Adj Im. Advice
Submitted Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2024/09/18 [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

10
18 Sep
2024
16:26

Label Removed (30650):Non-Reporting. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

11
18 Sep
2024
16:27

Clm Dtl Modified Insured Name: -> LION CITY RENTALS PTE LTD. Insured ID: -> 201504621K. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

12
18 Sep
2024
18:02

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:0.00:PODS Liability: 100% - BOLA 23 Remark: Based on the video footage insured
reverse into the carpark lot and hit third party left portion of vehicle.

[A] NA MENG
YAN

13
19 Sep
2024
10:18

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident-part 2 [I] Priya

14
19 Sep
2024
10:19

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident-part 2 [I] Priya

15
19 Sep
2024
10:19

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident-TP [I] Priya

16
19 Sep
2024
10:21

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2024/09/18. Mandate Remarks: Liability is clear in TP favour.
Pls proceed with DS. [I] Priya

17
19 Sep
2024
10:21

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00:Liability is clear in TP favour. Pls proceed with DS. [I] Priya

18
25 Nov
2024
09:49

Adj Rpt Initiated [A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

19
25 Nov
2024
09:49

Clm Dtl Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3. [A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

20
25 Nov
2024
09:49

Clm Dtl Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2024/08/02. [A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

21
25 Nov
2024
09:49

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

22
29 Nov
2024
11:55

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:5186.30:Liability: 100% *Quantum: $ 5,186.30(all-in). Pls refer to adjuster report
for details. *For your approval please.

[A] NA MENG
YAN

23
02 Dec
2024
10:41

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident-TP [I] Priya

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=73712&CFTOKEN=bc28b14ec8fe843-6A6DAA0A-CC99-545B-D4834F133D2759B2&USID=11391&RID=6684085
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=73712&CFTOKEN=bc28b14ec8fe843-6A6DAA0A-CC99-545B-D4834F133D2759B2&USID=11391&RID=6684085
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=73712&CFTOKEN=bc28b14ec8fe843-6A6DAA0A-CC99-545B-D4834F133D2759B2&USID=11391&RID=6684085
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=73712&CFTOKEN=bc28b14ec8fe843-6A6DAA0A-CC99-545B-D4834F133D2759B2&USID=11391&RID=6684085&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1460329%26extid%3D462973%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=73712&CFTOKEN=bc28b14ec8fe843-6A6DAA0A-CC99-545B-D4834F133D2759B2&USID=11391&RID=6684085


  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

24
02 Dec
2024
10:44

Adj Mandate Set Approved:5186.30. [I] Priya

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
[11/09/2024 14:31] HOW MEI KWAN:
TP VIDEO - https://drive.google.com/drive/folders/1a7wSftPi67nFx7Xjted079MwFbbCmsdn?usp=sharing

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

3233146 10 Sep 2024
09:17:00

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

SGB17J SLQ3924H 12.00

3235658 13 Sep 2024
13:11:10

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SGB17J SLQ3924H 12.00

3235800 13 Sep 2024
15:26:50 Video Upload Motor

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

SGB17J Priya xx.xx

3235804 13 Sep 2024
15:27:27 Video Upload Motor

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

SGB17J Priya xx.xx

3235805 13 Sep 2024
15:27:29 Video Upload Motor

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

SGB17J Priya xx.xx
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