
Date 10.09.2024

Your ref

Our ref

DOA: 01.09.2024 TIME: 

1 Cost of Repair ($7800
2 Loss of Rental  (9 days
3 Purchase of Third Party's Insurer 
4 Sundries

Yours faithfully,

1) GIA report

We refer to the above matter and write on behalf of SAMSAN ENGINEERING PTE LTD, the registered owner of 
SLN2581K in respect of  the above accident. 

2) LTA / Insurer Search                  

4) Car Rental Agreement / Receipt   

We are instructed that the above accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving / or management of 
your insured vehicle.  Your insured’s vehicle SHA4588U collided onto the rear end of our client's vehicle 
SLN2581K.  As a result of the accident, our client has been put to loss and expenses, particulars of which are as 
follows : -

Focus Auto Pte Ltd
UEN No. 201004495R
GST Reg. No. 201004495R
Tel : 6886 9097   Fax : 6481 9095
Email : claims@focusauto.com.sg

 BY  E-MAIL 

SND6053X

 + 9%GST) $ 8,502.00

YVONNE LOW

The demand herein is in respect of our client’s for damages pertaining to his motor vehicle and any 
settlement following or subsequent to this demand shall not prejudice any claim in respect of personal 
injuries.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents within 7 days and your favourable reply is deeply 
appreciated.

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
16 RAFFLES QUAY #42-01 HONG LEONG BUILDING
SINGAPORE 048581

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : (SLN2581K & SHA4588U ALONG PIE EXIT TO CTE)
20:50 HOURS

$ 10,154.18

Enclosed are the following documents for your perusal.

Dear Sir/Madam,

Total Amount :

$ 30.00

 

$ 1,620.00×  $180)
$ 2.18

    3) Original repair claim

SLN2581K

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



01.09.2024

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd 

SLN2581K & SHA4588U

PIE EXIT CTE 01.09.2024
SAMSAN ENGINEERING PTE LTD 201719812E

12 ARUMUGAM ROAD #02-02N LTC BUILDING B SINGAPORE 409958
SLN2581K

SLN2581K

SAMSAN ENGINEERING PTE LTD
201719812E



15/11/2024



Date

7,800.00$        

$ 7,800.00
$ 702.00

$ 8,502.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS :
EIGHT THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED AND TWO 
DOLLARS ONLY

MOTOR VEHICLE NO : SLN2581K KIA CERATO

       Total : 

LUMP SUM       

Focus Auto Pte Ltd
Business Reg. No: 201004495R

GST Reg. No: 201004495R
No 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Autobay

#02-50 Singapore 417883

       9% GST : 

10.09.2024

      Sub- total : 

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
16 RAFFLES QUAY #42-01 HONG LEONG BUILDING
SINGAPORE 048581

LUMP SUM REPAIR
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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 25 October 2024 10:03 PM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE:  D24007739MFCT/CTPL/JY - SLN2581K ,SHA4588U AND SKW8922K ACCIDENT 

ON 01.09.2024 ***LKK Ref: CD/FCI24090118/Uma3

Dear Daphne, 
 
Refer to your email below. 
 
Pls proceed as your email below. 
 
 
Thanks, and regards, 
 
 
Joanne Yong 
Motor Claims 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 16 RaƯles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building Singapore 048581 | TEL: 6359 
1823 | Fax No. : 6223 0541 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C 

  
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. 
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. 
If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 25 October 2024 10:11 am 
To: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: D24007739MFCT/CTPL/JY - SLN2581K ,SHA4588U AND SKW8922K ACCIDENT ON 01.09.2024 ***LKK 
Ref: CD/FCI24090118/Uma3 
 
Dear Joanne, 
 
Refer to the above matter 
 
We are pending mandate for your approval. TP repairer asking for settlement. 
 
Thank you 
 

Best Regards, 

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 12:37 PM 
To: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: D24007739MFCT/CTPL/JY - SLN2581K ,SHA4588U AND SKW8922K ACCIDENT ON 01.09.2024 ***LKK 
Ref: CD/FCI24090118/Uma3 
 
Dear Joanne, 
 
Your Ref: D24007739MFCT/CTPL/JY 
 
We refer to the above matter and your email below. 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN 2581K AND SHA 4588U ON 01/09/2024 
 
We have highlighted to your good office on 04/09/2024 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, MS First Capital Limited. 
 
It is an accident under BOLA:28. 3 vehicles chain collision (OID last). 
 
Basing on the report of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD is as follows: - 
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair $ 18,435.95 $ 8,502.00 (L/S) (w/GST) 
2. Loss of Rental (9 days x $180.00) $   1,620.00 $    900.00 (9 days x $100.00) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $           2.18 $        2.18 
4. Sundries $         30.00 $         0.00 
Total $ 20,088.13 $ 9,404.18 

 
*7 days recommendation for repair. 
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 06/09/2024 is only for mandate purpose. 
 
The above is for your approval please. 
 
Thank You.  
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 6 September 2024 1:42 PM 
To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 
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