Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, September 4, 2024 5:24 PM

To: assignments; SUR

Subject: FW: MSFC REF: D24007775MFVS/OD/KT - ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE5739) ON

02.09.2024 // INSURED: CHANGI AIRPORT GROUP (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

Hi
Fyna.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 September 2024 5:23 PM

To: jared.woon@changiairport.com; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: MSFC REF: D24007775MFVS/OD/KT - ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE5739) ON 02.09.2024 // INSURED: CHANGI
AIRPORT GROUP (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

Dear Mr Woon,
We refer to our teleconversation earlier.

As spoken, we have appointed Bryan of LKK Auto for the survey. Kindly liase with Bryan for the
necessary.

Aside to Bryan,
You may contact Jared Woon at 8748 4985 for the survey.

Kindly acknowledge.

Best Regards,

Karew Tawn

Motor Claims Dept.
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building Singapore 048581 | DID : 6359 1805

| Fax No. : 6223 0541 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
atremver of [[IRTRAE] INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for
details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.




Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not
copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.



