Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: SURVEY2 <survey2@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 3:49 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team

Cc: survey@kkimhin.com.sg; 'Simon’

Subject: RE: SNR6798G OD Great American Finalization-DOA: 30/8/2024

Good afternoon.
COR of $5350 before $700 excess & GST, 5 days under L/S confirmed.

Thanks.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 3:26 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team; survey2 @kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: survey@kkimhin.com.sg; Simon

Subject: RE: SNR6798G OD Great American Finalization-DOA: 30/8/2024

Dear Shawn,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $5,350.00 (before excess $700 and GST) with 5 days of
repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 4:22 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SNR6798G OD Great American Finalization

From: SURVEY2 <survey2@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 4:20:08 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: survey@kkimhin.com.sg <survey@kkimhin.com.sg>; simon@kkimhin.com.sg <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>
Subject: SNR6798G OD Great American Finalization

Our Ref: 024544



Good afternoon sir.

To confirm COR at $5350 before $700 excess & GST, 5 days under L/S.
Hope to receive your confirmation soon.

Thanks.

Regards,
Shawn Chua



