Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2025 2:32 PM

To: alicechau@kanfs.net

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBG4911J) (OD) / UOI - Finalization & photo
Attachments: GBG4911) final_021257.pdf

Hi Alice,

COR /s $13750, 8 days.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2024 4:58 pm

To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: GBG4911J (OD) / UOI - Finalization & photo

Dear Taufikh,

With reference to the mentioned claim, please confirm and finalise.
Thank you.

Regards,

Alice

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop

Tel:6747 9560
Fax:6748 1006



