Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2024 1:15 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalize For SNR5609B (DOA 01/09/2024) - TP (SMRT)
Dear Rasul,

Noted with thanks.

Regards,
Vivian Tan
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748 | Fax : 6251 3161
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Make Life a Beautiful Ride

On Thu, 26 Sept 2024 at 11:52, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Vivian,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $7,600.00 /- with 08 days of repair before GST, subject to
their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth: Frint only wher necessary-

From: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 September 2024 2:07 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalize For SNR5609B (DOA 01/09/2024) - TP (SMRT)

Without Prejudice



Dear Rasul,

Finalise COR @ L/S S$7,600.00 (before GST)

08 working days

Attach the adjustment Estimate and after paint photos for your reference.

Please check & revert for confirmation.

Thank you & warmest regards.

Regards,
Vivian Tan
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748 | Fax : 6251 3161
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Make Life a Beautiful Ride



