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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 23 December 2024 9:45 AM
To: enquiry@sinsheng.com.sg
Cc: quek.benghoe@sinsheng.com.sg
Subject: RE: PRI ~ Vehicle: GBC2492K (DOA: 03/09/2024) || 20767MID - Claiming 3rd party
Attachments: DV_GBC2492K.pdf

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
Thank you for your acceptance. 
We confirm settlement at $3,100.00(all-in). 
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with a copy of LOA with company stamp/chop to us (LKK) for 
our necessary action. 
 

 
 
Please let us have your company bank details for payment processing. 
  

Account Name    
Account Number    
Bank Name    
Bank & Branch Code    

 
 

Cheers to a Wonderful Christmas and a Happy New Year 2025 !   

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: enquiry@sinsheng.com.sg <enquiry@sinsheng.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2024 10:16 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: quek.benghoe@sinsheng.com.sg 
Subject: PRI ~ Vehicle: GBC2492K (DOA: 03/09/2024) || 20767MID - Claiming 3rd party 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
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We  accept your offer. 
May you forward DV by return please. 
 
Thank you & Best regards, 
Sharon for Quek Beng Hoe 
Sin Sheng Auto Workshop Pte Ltd 
No 5, Tuas Ave 3, Singapore 639405 
Tel : 6416 1996, Fax 6863 1944 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2024 9:50 am 
To: Enquiry - Sin Sheng <enquiry@sinsheng.com.sg> 
Cc: quek.benghoe@sinsheng.com.sg 
Subject: RE: PRI ~ Vehicle: GBC2492K (DOA: 03/09/2024) || 20767MID - Claiming 3rd party 
 
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We propose settlement as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair  $ 2,700.00 
2. Loss of Use (5days x $80.00) $    400.00 

Total $ 3,100.00 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
 

Cheers to a Wonderful Christmas and a Happy New Year 2025 !   

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2024 10:16 AM 
To: Enquiry - Sin Sheng <enquiry@sinsheng.com.sg> 
Cc: quek.benghoe@sinsheng.com.sg 
Subject: RE: PRI ~ Vehicle: GBC2492K (DOA: 03/09/2024) || 20767MID - Claiming 3rd party 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 30/10/2024.  
 
We will look into the matter and get back to you. 
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Thanks. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
 

From: Enquiry - Sin Sheng <enquiry@sinsheng.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2024 10:09 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: quek.benghoe@sinsheng.com.sg 
Subject: RE: PRI ~ Vehicle: GBC2492K (DOA: 03/09/2024) || 20767MID - Claiming 3rd party 
 

Dear Hsia Tong, 

Enclosed LOD and relevant documents for your necessary action. 

 
 
For further clarification, please do not hesitate to call me. 
Thank you and have a great day. 
 
Best Regards, 

Kerry Lee 
Finance & Administration 
Sin Sheng Auto Workshop Pte Ltd  
No. 5 Tuas Avenue 3. BS Logistics Hub. Singapore 639405  
T: (65) 6416 1996(Ext:996)|F: (65) 6863 1944  
 
CONFIDENTIALITY - this email is intended for the named only.  It may contain private and confidential information that is 
privileged.  If this has come to you in error you must take no action based on it nor must you copy it or show it to anyone.  Please 
notify us immediately and delete all copies of this message. 
 
 
 


