












 
 

 

To Accounting/Finance Department: 

Please see below for the payment details of Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd. 

Company Details  
Company Name Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Company Reg No.  201006949C 
Address Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716 
Contact No. 67415336  

 
Bank Transfer Details  
Beneficiary  Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Bank Name OCBC 
Bank Branch North (695) 
Bank Address 460 North Bridge Road #01-00, Singapore 188734 
Bank Code 7339 
Branch Code 695 
SWIFT Code OCBCSGSG 
Bank Account No.  695235432001 
Currency SGD 
Remittance Attention to Email accounts@procarcare.com.sg 

  
Paynow Corporate Details  
Company Name Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
UEN for Paynow 201006949C 

 

Warm regards, 

Dawn Wang 

Manager 

mailto:accounts@procarcare.com.sg
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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, October 28, 2024 11:33 AM
To: Yan (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: [RESEND]FW: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) GBJ5658T

Dear Yan 
 
Plese proceed and offer as per below: 
 
COR - $16,132.00 
LOR - $1,400.00 to $1,500.00 
Total – $17,532.00 to $17,632.00 
 
 
Thank you  
 
Emily Tan 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
  
Confidentiality Notice:  
This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you 
have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 

From: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, October 25, 2024 5:46 PM 
To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [RESEND]FW: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) GBJ5658T 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Your ref: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD2 
Our ref : CD/FCI24090032/Uua3 
 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3993P(MS FCIL) AND GBJ 5658T(TP) ON 29/08/2024 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
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SHA 3993P(OI) -> GBJ 5658T(TP) -> SND 6200D 

This is a 3 vehicles chain collision whereby our insured was the last vehicle. In accordance with the MCF guideline 
for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 

  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “PROGRESSIVE CAR CARE PTE LTD" at $17,632.00(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: -  
   

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair  $ 30,075.72 $ 16,132.00 ($14,800.00+9%GST)  
2. Loss of Rental (21days x $100.00) $   2,100.00 $    1,500.00 (15days X $100.00) 

Total $ 32,175.72 $  17,632.00 
   
Surveyor recommended 12 days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 25/10/2024 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 
Yan 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Email: yan@lkkauto.com| DID: 6841-6051 | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: Yan (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Friday, October 25, 2024 5:43 PM 
To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) GBJ5658T 
 
Your ref: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD2 
Our ref : CD/FCI24090032/Uua3 
 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3993P(MS FCIL) AND GBJ 5658T(TP) ON 29/08/2024 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
 

SHA 3993P(OI) -> GBJ 5658T(TP) -> SND 6200D 

This is a 3 vehicles chain collision whereby our insured was the last vehicle. In accordance with the MCF guideline 
for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 

  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “PROGRESSIVE CAR CARE PTE LTD" at $4,913.05(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: -  
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Amount Claimed Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair  $ 30,075.72 $ 16,132.00 ($14,800.00+9%GST)  
2. Loss of Rental (21days x $100.00) $   2,100.00 $    1,500.00 (15days X $100.00) 

Total $ 32,175.72 $  17,632.00 
   
Surveyor recommended 12 days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 25/10/2024 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 
Yan 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Email: yan@lkkauto.com| DID: 6841-6051 | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, October 25, 2024 3:00 PM 
To: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) GBJ5658T 
 
Dear Yan 
 
No worries !!  
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Emily Tan 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
Website hƩp://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data ProtecƟon Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data CollecƟon Statement. 
  
ConfidenƟality NoƟce:  
This e-mail is confidenƟal. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have 
received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and noƟfy the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 

From: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, October 25, 2024 2:52 PM 
To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) GBJ5658T 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
 
 
 

Dear Emily, 
 
Thank you for the email. 
 
We are preparing report to seek mandate. 
 
We will expedite the matter. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 
Yan 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Email: yan@lkkauto.com| DID: 6841-6051 | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2024 3:41 PM 
To: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) 
 
Dear Yan 
 
AƩached is TP LOD.  
 
Once ready, you can send me for mandate. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Emily Tan 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
Website hƩp://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data ProtecƟon Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
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Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data CollecƟon Statement. 
  
ConfidenƟality NoƟce:  
This e-mail is confidenƟal. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have 
received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and noƟfy the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 

From: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, October 1, 2024 1:53 PM 
To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Neo Jie Si <NeoJieSi@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Betty Wong <BettyWong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Lim Gan Koon (Chris) 
<ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
 
 
Dear Emily 
 
Please refer to attached LOD for your early settlement. 
Thank you 

 
Regards, 
  
Siew Chin 

Claims Advisory 
Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716 
T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 
E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  
W: www.procarcare.com.sg  
  

 
  
IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended 

recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 

immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. 
 

From: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, September 4, 2024 11:28 AM 
To: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg> 
Cc: Neo Jie Si <NeoJieSi@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Betty Wong <BettyWong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Lim Gan Koon (Chris) 
<ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Siew Chin 
 
Liability is clear but quantum to be agreed. 
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Thank you  
 
Emily Tan 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
  
Confidentiality Notice:  
This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you 
have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 

From: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, September 3, 2024 12:09 PM 
To: Betty Wong <BettyWong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Neo Jie Si <NeoJieSi@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Claims 
<claims@procarcare.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Hi Betty, 
 
Appreciate if you can advise on accident liability  
 
Regards, 
  
Siew Chin 

Claims Advisory 
Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716 
T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 
E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  
W: www.procarcare.com.sg  
  

 
  
IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended 

recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 

immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. 
 

From: Betty Wong <BettyWong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, September 3, 2024 8:19 AM 
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To: assignments@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg>; Neo Jie Si <NeoJieSi@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Emily Tan Su Min 
<EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) 
 
Insured Vehicle No : SHA3993P 
TP Vehicle No      : GBJ5658T 
Claim No           : D24007699MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 
Workshop Name      : PROGRESSIVE CAR CARE PTE LTD 
Our Surveyor       : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 
InstrucƟons       : Direct SeƩlement 
(SUBJECTED TO QUANTUM TO BE AGREED) 
Created By         : BETTYWON 
Verified By        : EMILYTAN 
Approved By        : NEOJIE 
 
 
 
This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail. 
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