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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Seloshinah Sinivasagam <seloshinah@motorimage.net>
Sent: Friday, 1 November 2024 9:21 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: LKINSTEAM
Subject: REF: D24007504MFCT / CCPL / TPD 2 OUR REF: SLT5270G YOUR REF: SHB4723R 

DOA: 23 AUG 2024 TP - PENDING PAYMENT
Attachments: SLT5270G LOD.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
Good Day Sir/Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter and client’s claim. 
  
Our LOD as per below: 

Cost of Repair S$ 2,633.44 (Inclusive GST) 

Loss of Use S$    360.00 ( 3 days) 

GIA Fee S$         2.18 

TOTAL S$ 2,995.62 

  
Kindly confirm the acceptance. 
 
Thanks & Regards 
 
Shinah   
Admin Assistant  
Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 
25 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159097 
DID: +65 6703 8163 
Email: seloshinah@motorimage.net 
Website: www.tanchong.com :: www.subaru.asia 
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Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or 
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The 
sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.  





 
 

MS First Capital Insurance Limited 
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 
(UEN 195000106C GST Reg. No. M2-0001676-9) 

 

6 Raffles Quay, #21-00 Singapore 048580| Tel: (65) 6359 1700 Fax: (65) 6222 3547 
Claims & Motor Underwriting Dept. 
16 Raffles Quay, #42-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 Tel: (65) 6359 1800 Fax: (65) 6223 0541 

 

DISCHARGE RECEIPT 

 

 
CLAIM REFERENCE : D24007504MFCT 
 
ACCIDENT DATE : 23/08/2024 
 
ACCIDENT LOCATION : SINARAN DR 
 
INSURED  : CITYCAB PTE LTD 
 
INSURED DRIVER : ONG KOCK HUE 
 
INSURED VEHICLE : SHB4723R 
 
INVOLVED PARTY : SLT5270G 
 
SETTLEMENT SUM : $ 2,875.62 

 

I/We, the undernoted CLAIMANT being the person/entity entitled to receive the compensation in 
relation to the accident, hereby agree to accept the SETTLEMENT SUM as full and final settlement of 
all claims for damages, costs & disbursements arising out of the ACCIDENT, and I/WE also agree that 
the said settlement sum: 
 

 
1. is paid without admission of liability on the part of MS First Capital Insurance Limited and/or 

its INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER in respect of the said loss and for damage 
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, 

 
2. is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said MS First Capital Insurance Limited and /or its 

INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and finally discharged from all claims 
whatsoever which I/WE now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or 
traceable to the said accident. 

 
 
I/WE acknowledge that this DISCHARGE RECEIPT is not to be construed as an admission of liability 
on the 
part of MS First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it 
shall not be 
used as evidence in any claims or actions which may be made against them or any of them. 
 

 

CLAIMANT: OOI MUN SIANG   Signature and Date : 
         
 

 

WITNESS :         Signature and Date : 

 

 

13th Jan 2025DENNIS LEONG JIA HUI
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Seloshinah Sinivasagam <seloshinah@motorimage.net>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2024 4:47 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: LKINSTEAM
Subject: Re: REF: D24007504MFCT / CCPL / TPD 2 OUR REF: SLT5270G YOUR REF: SHB4723R 

DOA: 23 AUG 2024 TP - PENDING PAYMENT

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Hsiao, 
 
Thanks for the offer, below are the bank details for the payment process. 
 
Bank A/C Payee Name : Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 
Bank Acct no : 901-355-461-3 
Payee Bank Name : UOB 
Bank Code : 7375 
Branch Code : 001 
Swift Code : UOVBSGSG 
Payee Email : yeo_boon_siong@tanchong.com 
 
Kindly update our accounts Dept. once the payment is done. 
 
Appreciate you can process payment as soonest. 
 
Regards, 
 

Shinah 

Motor Claims Department - Admin  

 

MOTOR IMAGE ENTERPRISES PTE LTD 

25 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159097 

DID: +65 6703 8104 

Email: seloshinah@motorimage.net 

Website: www.tanchong.com :: www.subaru.asia 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 2 December 2024 9:26 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - (OUR REF:  D24007504MFCT ) *** LKK REF: 

CD/FCI24080519/Rpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong  
 
Plese proceed and offer as per below: 
 
COR - $2,633.44 
LOU - $240.00 TO $300.00 ($80 TO $100 X 3D) 
LTA/GIA Fee - $2.18  
Total – $2,875.62 TO $2,935.62 
 
Thank you  
 
Emily Tan 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
  
Confidentiality Notice:  
This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If 
you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. 

From: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 29 November 2024 3:38 pm 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - (OUR REF: D24007504MFCT ) *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24080519/Rpa3 
 
Dear Hsiao, 
 
Apologies for delay reply to you. 
 
 
This matter will be handled by my colleague Ms Emily. She has cope in this email. 
 
 
Dear Emily, 
 
FYA 
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Thanks, and regards, 
 
 
Joanne Yong 
Motor Claims 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 16 RaƯles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building Singapore 048581 | TEL: 6359 
1823 | Fax No. : 6223 0541 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C 

  
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. 
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. 
If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 29 November 2024 9:09 am 
To: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - (OUR REF: D24007504MFCT ) *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24080519/Rpa3 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, 
opening attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Dear Joanne, 
 
Please advise mandate, Thanks. 
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 4 November 2024 10:23 AM 
To: JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - (OUR REF: D24007504MFCT ) *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24080519/Rpa3 
 
Your ref: D24007504MFCT 
Our ref : CD/FCI24080519/Rpa3 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB4723R(MS FCIL) AND SLT5270G(TP) ON 23/08/2024 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
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It is a head-to-rear collision. We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “MOTOR IMAGE ENTERPRISES PTE LTD" at $2,935.62(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair (with GST) $ 7,710.66 $ 2,633.44 ($2,416.00 + 9%GST) 
2. Loss of Use (3days x $120.00) $    360.00 $    300.00 (3days x $100.00) 
3. LTA/GIA SEARCH FEE $        2.18 $        2.18 

Total $ 8,072.84 $ 2,935.62 
   
Surveyor recommended 3days for repair. 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 04/11/2024 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.  
  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 12 September 2024 6:53 PM 
To: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24007504MFCT ) *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24080519/Rpa3 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above maƩer. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  
•             TP esƟmated cost of repair 
•             Preliminary advice 
•             Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condiƟon 
 
Please note that our officer in charge is Hsiao Tong. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 28 August 2024 9:16 AM 
To: Betty Wong <BettyWong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: ) 
 
Dear Betty, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Betty Wong <BettyWong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2024 4:11 PM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Dennis Leong <dennisleong@motorimage.net>; LKINSTEAM <LKINSTEAM@tanchong.org>; Jeffery Tan 
<jefferytan@motorimage.net>; Syaiful Bahri Bin Affendi <syaifulbahri@motorimage.net>; Joanne Yong Lai Fong 
<JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: ) 
 
Insured Vehicle No : SHB4723R 
TP Vehicle No      : SLT5270G 
Claim No           : D24007504MFCT / CCPL / TPD 2 
Workshop Name      : MOTOR IMAGE ENTERPRISES PTE LTD 
Our Surveyor       : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 
InstrucƟons       : Direct SeƩlement 
But quantum to be agreed 
Created By         : BETTYWON 
Verified By        : JOANNEYO 
Approved By        : JOANNEYO 
 
 
 
This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail. 
 
 
 


