




MS^FirstCapital
A Member of HlNSURANCEGROUP

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
v/wv/.msfirstcapkal.com.sg
(UEN 19S000106C GST Reg. No. M2-0001676-9)

DISCHARGE RECEIPT

CLAIM REFERENCE

ACCIDENT DATE

ACCIDENT LOCATION

INSURED

INSURED DRIVER

INSURED VEHICLE

INVOLVED PARP(/

SETTLEMENT SUM

D24004296MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2

11/05/2024

: UPPER THOMSON RD SHELL PETROL STATION

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD

HENGHUASUNG

SHA4573L

FBW939Y

$10,580.00

1/We, the undernoted CLAIMANT being the person/entity entitled to receive the compensation in relation to the
accident, hereby agree to accept the SETTLEMENT SUM as full and final settlement of ail claims for damages,
costs & disbursements arising out of the ACCIDENT, and IAA/E also agree that the said settlement sum:

2.

is paid without admission of liability on the part of MS First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its
INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER in respect of the said loss and for damage whether now or
hereafter to become manifest,

is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said MS First Capital Insurance Limited and /or its INSURED
and/or its INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and finally discharged from all claims whatsoever which
[/WE now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or traceable to the said accident.

IA/VE acknowledge that this DISCHARGE RECEIPT is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the
part of MS First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it shall not be
used as evidence in any claims or actions which may be made against them or any of them.

CLAIMANT: Muhammad Faizal Bahari

WITNESS : TC^VV C^O^- '-O1^-

^^^ 12 Jan 2025
gnature and Date :

Signature and Date ^ ^\^

6 Raffles Quay, #21-00 Singapore 0485801 TeL (65) 6359 1700 Fax: (6S) 6222 3547
Claims & Nkitor Underwriting DepL
16 RaFfles Quay, #42-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048S81 Tel (65) 6359 1800 Fax. (65) 6223 0541
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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: raymond <raymond@bhh.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 13 January 2025 3:38 PM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: DV - (OUR REF: D24004296MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2) Accident Involving FBW939Y & 

SHA4573L on 11/05/2024 ***LKK Ref: CD/FCI24080480/Uma3
Attachments: First Capital DV - FBW939Y.pdf

Dear Daphne, 
 
We attached the signed DV for your perusal. 
 
Please refer to our bank particulars below. 
 

Company Name Ban Hock Hin Company Private Limited 

Contact Number 6281 6520 

GST Registration Date 01/04/94 

GST Registration Number M2-0010542-7 

Contact Email (for payment advice to be sent to) raymond@bhh.com.sg 

   
Beneficiary's Bank's Details 

Bank Name DBS Bank Ltd 

Bank Branch Towner Road 

Bank Address 
12 Marina Boulevard, DBS Asia Central,  Marina Bay 
Financial Centre Tower 3, Singapore 018982 

Bank Code 7171 

Branch Code 025 

SWIFT Code DBSSSGSG 

  
Beneficiary's Details 

Beneficiary's Name Ban Hock Hin Company Private Limited 

Beneficiary's Account No. 025-0085663 

Beneficiary's Registered 
Address 

No 8 Defu South Street 1 #04-28 S(533758) 

Beneficiary's Mailing Address No 8 Defu South Street 1 #04-28 S(533758) 

 
 
 
 
Thanks 

Best Regards, 
Raymond 
Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd 
Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969 
Visit us at https://www.bhh.com.sg  
Facebook: https://www.facebook.com/bhhsg  
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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 3 January 2025 2:15 PM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: (OUR REF: D24004296MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) Accident Involving FBW939Y & 

SHA4573L on 11/05/2024 ***LKK REF: CD/FCI24080480/Uma3

Dear Daphne  
 
Plese proceed and offer as per below: 
 
COR - $10,481.11 
LOU - $100.00 to $150.00 ($20-$30X 5D) 
GIA fee - $2.18  
Total – $10,583.29 TO $10,633.29 
 
Thank you  
 
Emily Tan 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
  
Confidentiality Notice:  
This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If 
you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. 

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 2 January 2025 11:12 am 
To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: (OUR REF: D24004296MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) Accident Involving FBW939Y & SHA4573L on 11/05/2024 
***LKK REF: CD/FCI24080480/Uma3 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, 
opening attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Dear Emily, 
 
Your Ref: D24004296MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 
 
We refer to the above matter and your email below. 
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ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBW 939Y AND SHA 4573L ON 11/05/2024 
 
We have highlighted to your good office on 28/08/2024 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, MS First Capital Limited. 
 
It is an accident under BOLA:NIL. OID left turning into petrol station collided TP going straight from left lane.. 
 
Basing on the report of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer BAN HOCK HIN CO., PTE LTD is as follows: - 
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair $ 14,146.00 $ 10,481.11 (P/P) (w/GST) 
2. Loss of Use (5 days x $30.00) $       150.00 $       100.00 (5 days x $20.00) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $           2.18 $           2.18 
Total $ 14,298.18 $ 10,583.29 

 
*5 days recommendation for repair. 
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 02/01/2025 is only for mandate purpose. 
 
The above is for your approval please. 
 
Thank You 
 
 

Cheers to a Wonderful Christmas and a Happy New Year 2025 ! 
 

Best Regards, 

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2024 4:25 PM 
To: raymond <raymond@bhh.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBW939Y & SHA4573L on 11/05/2024 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Raymond  
 
Thank you for the phone conversaƟon earlier.  
 
We are well-aware of this maƩer and to inform you, LKK will revert once their paperwork has been completed.  
 
Please note that our finance is also closed for the year and we are unable to make any payments unƟl 2025. 
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