Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Douglas Ong <douglas_ong@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Friday, 20 September 2024 10:48 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: TP / SCU 1000Y/371333 / SEEK MANDATE

<Confidential>

Dear Veron
Kindly renegotiate @ L/SUM 2,400.00 at 4 w/days.
Thanks.

* Starting from 1 Oct 2023, MSIG will not accept any cheque payment anymore to support MAS's initiative on
elimination of cheques.

Best Regards

Douglas Ong
Claims Services (Motor)
D: 6012 1346 | douglas ong@sg.msig-asia.com

@ s

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre 2, Singapore 068807 | T: +65 6220 9644 |
fAOXinJO

F: +65 62256371 | Co. Reg. No.200412212G | msig.com.sg

AMember of AT INSURANCE GROUP

Please note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and processing your personal data
for the purpose of assessing your claim. This may include disclosing and sharing your personal data with our service providers and/or with other
insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance Association of Singapore, for the proper processing, handling and/or
dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws (collectively, "the Purpose”). We may also
need to disclose or share your personal data with service providers who are sited outside Singapore for the Purpose.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any person other than the
intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 September 2024 10:46 AM

To: Douglas Ong <douglas_ong@sg.msig-asia.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP / SCU 1000Y/371333 / SEEK MANDATE

<Confidential>

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any
attachment(s).




Dear Douglas,

Any update, as repairer is chasing.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2024 4:34 PM

To: Douglas Ong <douglas ong@sg.msig-asia.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP / SCU 1000Y/371333 / SEEK MANDATE

Dear Douglas,
We have offer repairer as per your recommendation LS $2,300/ 3 days.

Kindly refer reply from repairer.



VEHICLE NO: SCU1000Y

Yvonne Wong <yvonnewong@tts.com.sg=
To Veron Chen (LEKAuto)

Hi Veron

We are not accept the LS $2300.00 and 3 days repair. The tailgate has been dented and your surveyor insist us to

The car is with us from 24/08/2024 to 31/08/2024,
Best regards

Yvonne Wong
Motor Claims Executive
T: (65) 6757 2622 Ext 120 | M:{65) 9753 7000

@Y s cunocurs

iﬁ We are committed to the preservation of the environment. Please print this email only if it is absolutely necessary.

TTS Motor Group Pte Lrd (UEN: 1987029957)

TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd (UEN: 200413930H)

Main Office and Showroom: 2 Chang Cham Road Singapore 155631 Tel: Sales +65 6287 3355, Admin & Finance +65 6757 0122
Aftersales and Workshop: 2 Defu South Street 1 #04-04 JTC Defu Industrial City Singapore 533735 Tel: 6757 2622

Website: www.ts.com.se
Disclaimer: The information contained in this email, including any attachments, may contain confidential information of TTS Motor Group |

email in error or have reason to believe that you are not authorized to receive it, please notify the sender by return email and promptly de

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Douglas Ong <douglas ong@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2024 10:20 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP / SCU 1000Y/371333 / SEEK MANDATE

<Confidential>

Dear Veron
Our mandate is:

LS $2,300.00 + GST - 3 days.



Please convey to workshop. Thanks.

* Starting from 1 Oct 2023, MSIG will not accept any cheque payment anymore to support MAS’s initiative on
elimination of cheques.

Best Regards
Douglas Ong

Claims Services (Motor)
D: 6012 1346 | douglas ong@sg.msig-asia.com

@ s

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre 2, Singapore 068807 | T: +65 6220 9644 |

F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No.200412212G | msig.com.sg O {D {:]

A Member of BN INSURANCE GROUP

Please note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and processing your personal data
for the purpose of assessing your claim. This may include disclosing and sharing your personal data with our service providers and/or with other
insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance Association of Singapore, for the proper processing, handling and/or
dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws (collectively, "the Purpose”). We may also
need to disclose or share your personal data with service providers who are sited outside Singapore for the Purpose.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any person other than the
intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.

From: Douglas Ong

Sent: Monday, 16 September 2024 2:10 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP / SCU 1000Y/371333 / SEEK MANDATE

Dear Veron
Ok - would refer to IHS for their review.
Kindly bear with us.

* Starting from 1 Oct 2023, MSIG will not accept any cheque payment anymore to support MAS's initiative on
elimination of cheques.

Best Regards
Douglas Ong

Claims Services (Motor)
D: 6012 1346 | douglas ong@sg.msig-asia.com

@ s

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre 2, Singapore 068807 | T: +65 6220 9644 |

F: +65 62256371 | Co. Reg. No.200412212G | msig.com.sg o "b {D

AMember of AT INSURANCE GROUP



Please note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and processing your personal data
for the purpose of assessing your claim. This may include disclosing and sharing your personal data with our service providers and/or with other
insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance Association of Singapore, for the proper processing, handling and/or
dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws (collectively, "the Purpose”). We may also
need to disclose or share your personal data with service providers who are sited outside Singapore for the Purpose.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any person other than the
intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 16 September 2024 2:06 PM

To: Douglas Ong <douglas ong@sg.msig-asia.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: TP / SCU 1000Y/371333 / SEEK MANDATE

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any
attachment(s).

Dear Douglas,
Enclosed herewith SCU 1000Y report.
For your review please.

Photos uploaded in Merimen.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




