Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2024 11:53 AM

To: info@speedwerkz.biz

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SMW 7271M & XE 1460M (DOA: 26/08/2024) ***LKK Ref:
CD/11124080422/Uma3

Attachments: Sketch - XE1460M.JPG; Statement - XE1460M.JPG

Dear Sir/ Madam,
Refer to the above matter

After reviewed both parties accident report and scene photos, we are of the view that your client’s vehicle
damages more probable on our insured report statement as your client cut in from left collided with our
insured’s vehicle.

We regret to inform you that we are unable look into your claim.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphnelLee@Ikkauto.com|

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

----- Original Message-----

From: info@speedwerkz.biz <info@speedwerkz.biz>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 August 2024 9:52 AM

To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident Involving SMW 7271M & XE 1460M (DOA: 26/08/2024) ***LKK Ref: CD/11124080422/Uma3

Dear Daphne
We only have scene photos. No video

Best regards
Julie

———————— Original Message --------

Subject: Accident Involving SMW 7271M & XE 1460M (DOA: 26/08/2024) ***LKK Ref: CD/11124080422/Uma3
Date: 2024-08-28 08:40

From: "Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)" <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>

To: "info@speedwerkz.biz" <info@speedwerkz.biz>

Dear Julie,



