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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 12 September 2024 3:46 PM
To: Soon Lee VMS
Cc: Tian Yuh Sia; Darren Chiu; Gan Li Hui; Jia En Leong; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: Request for Finalized | GBL9219R DOA: 19/08/2024

Hi Jia En, 
 
As per our message, 
 
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $4,750.00 /- with 07 days of repair before GST, subject to 
their approval. 
 
Best Regards,  
Rasul | Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Soon Lee VMS <soonlee@completevms.com.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2024 9:25 am 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Tian Yuh Sia <sia@completevms.com.sg>; Darren Chiu <darren@completevms.com.sg>; Gan Li Hui 
<lihui@completevms.com.sg>; Jia En Leong <jiaen@completevms.com.sg> 
Subject: Request for Finalized | GBL9219R DOA: 19/08/2024  
  
 
 
Without Prejudice 

Dear Rasul, 
 
Please find the above After Repair photo.  
 
Please Finalize and kindly provide a calculated final estimate. 

 
Complete VMS Pte. Ltd. 
5, Soon Lee Street, #01-54, Pioneer Point, S627607 
D (65) 6555 6111 
W https://www.completevms.com.sg 

 


