Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 29 October 2024 4:45 PM

To: Ifa

Cc: ‘Tee, Chee-Wah'

Subject: RE: Mutual client / AIG Ref: 8469535251SG / Your Ref: SIN64Z / Ho Jun Wei /

Accident involving SJIN64Z & GBF8473K on 14 Aug 2024

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Refer to your email as below

We unable forward you the third-party’s video footage and accident report due to PDPA.

Kindly send your request directly to third-party insurer on this matter and please update us the claim status.
Thank you

Best Regards,

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

From: Ifa <yas@alc.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 28 October 2024 2:53 PM

To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Tee, Chee-Wah' <Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com>

Subject: RE: Mutual client / AIG Ref: 8469535251SG / Your Ref: SIN64Z / Ho Jun Wei / Accident involving SIN64Z &
GBF8473K on 14 Aug 2024

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Daphne,

As spoken with our Ms Lina, kindly let us have the video footage and the other party report.
We will take our client’s instructions once received.

Thank you.

Regards,

Ifaw (Ms)

Arasan Law Chambers

151 Chin Swee Road #06-08 Manhattan House SG 169876 | DID: 6835 3350 | FAX: 6835 3352 |

This e-mail is from M/s Arasan Law Chambers, a firm of Advocates and Solicitors in Singapore, and is intended solely for the named
addressee. It contains confidential and/or legally privileged information. If the e-mail has reached you in error, please delete the e-mail
immediately and inform us of the error. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, arrive late or contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the
context of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission.



From: linalaw alc <alclinalaw @gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 28 October 2024 2:35 pm

To: Tee, Chee-Wah <Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com>; Ifa <yas@alc.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Mutual client / AIG Ref: 8469535251SG / Your Ref: SIN64Z / Ho Jun Wei / Accident involving SIN64Z &
GBF8473K on 14 Aug 2024

Without prejudice

Dear Mr Tee,

We have applied medical report on this matter and pending letter of demand in process.
We note that client has 2 days mc.

We will update your the status in due course.

Regards,
Alc

On Thu, 24 Oct 2024 at 5:07 PM, Tee, Chee-Wah <Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com> wrote:

Mutual client: Ho Jun Wei

Dear Lina,

We are advised by our insured that he has engaged your firm for his Bl claim.

We would like to check for his claim status as we have received third party claim against him as well.

Thank you.

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, | do not expect that you will read it, respond to it or act on it
until appropriate for you.

Tee Chee Wah
Claims Adjuster
Auto Claims

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.



AlG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10

Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1089

Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Annual leave notification —

Follow us:

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility
is accepted by AlIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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