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Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2024 12:19 PM
To: lina huang; assignments
Subject: RE: NEW MATTER - Survey of SIA damaged vehicle RU5937R - Damage to SIA 

vehicle (regn: RU5937R) and Qatar container (QKE61674QR) due to impact with 
SATS tractor DOL: 19.08.2024 (HFW Ref: 67925-451) [IMAN-ASIA.FID911792]

Dear Ms Limin, 
 
According to the lawyer (Elissa from Holman Fenwick Willan), withdraw the assignment as have 
decided not to go ahead with the inspection. 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: lina huang <limin.kanghuitrading@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, September 9, 2024 3:05 PM 
To: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: NEW MATTER - Survey of SIA damaged vehicle RU5937R - Damage to SIA vehicle (regn: RU5937R) and 
Qatar container (QKE61674QR) due to impact with SATS tractor DOL: 19.08.2024 (HFW Ref: 67925-451) [IMAN-
ASIA.FID911792] 
 
hi rajes 
 
does your surveyor have airport pass? if not how is he going to airside to assess the damage? 
 
 
Ms. Limin 
Business Development 
Manager 
 
KANG HUI TRADING PTE LTD 

江晖贸易私人有限公司 
 
 
PAYMENT A/C NO: OCBC CURRENT 601-817919-001  
 
 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, 
you must not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to 
any unauthorised person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if 
you receive this in error.” 
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On Fri, 6 Sept 2024 at 18:25, Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Limin, 

  

We on behalf of Elissa (Holman Fenwick) acting behalf SATS. 

Kindly arrange survey urgently. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: lina huang <limin.kanghuitrading@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, September 5, 2024 1:32 PM 
To: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: NEW MATTER - Survey of SIA damaged vehicle RU5937R - Damage to SIA vehicle (regn: RU5937R) and 
Qatar container (QKE61674QR) due to impact with SATS tractor DOL: 19.08.2024 (HFW Ref: 67925-451) [IMAN-
ASIA.FID911792] 

  

hi rajes 

  

may i know who made arrangements for the surveying? 
 

  

Ms. Limin 

Business Development 

Manager 
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KANG HUI TRADING PTE LTD 

江晖贸易私人有限公司 

  

  

PAYMENT A/C NO: OCBC CURRENT 601-817919-001  

  

  

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended 
addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in 
this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender 
immediately if you receive this in error.” 

  

  

On Thu, 5 Sept 2024 at 11:21, Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Kang Hui, 

  

As spoken just now, Kindly arrange survey for RU5937R. 

  

Let me know date, time and location a day in advance for appointment. 

  

Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


