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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: 2ND AUTO <accident.2ndauto@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 August 2024 6:29 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SPF-TP SKZ 4387R (DOA: 03/06/2024)

Hi Ms Chan, 
 
Noted with thanks 
 
On Tue, Aug 27, 2024 at 2:23 PM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

Without prejudice 

 
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $3,950.00 before GST with 4 days of repair, 
subject to their approval. 

  

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler 

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


